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1 M7646 2.5 Oct Classic Bells w/Damper & Moto Card 1 1,892.00$            1,892.00$    1,920.00$           

2 Euphonium, JEP1000 4 Valve Euphonium 1 1,205.00$            1,205.00$    1,275.00$           

3 Trombone, YSL200AD Trombone Lacquer 2 459.00$               918.00$        580.00$              

4 Alto Sax, YAS300AD Intermediate Advantage 2 1,334.00$            2,668.00$    1,700.00$           

5 Clarinet, YCL200AD Student Clarinet 3 342.00$               1,026.00$    425.00$              

6 Piccolo, PFP105E Pearl Interm. Piccolo 1 696.00$               696.00$        700.00$              

7 Violin full size KLAUS MUELLER MAESTRO, outfit 5 379.00$               1,895.00$    250.00$              

8 VIOLA 15", KLAUS MUELLER MAESTRO, outfit 2 427.00$               854.00$        295.00$              

9 Viola 14",KLAUS MUELLER MAESTRO, outfit 2 427.00$               854.00$        295.00$              

10 CELLO full size KLAUS MUELLER MAESTRO, outfit 2 951.00$               1,902.00$    500.00$              

11 Violin Outfit 4/4 Knilling School Model Violin Outfit 2 138.00$               276.00$        200.00$              

12 Flute  Gemeinhardt 2SP 2 308.00$               616.00$        315.00$              

13 Snare Drum Stands  Pearl  S1030L Concert Height, Double Braced 2 131.00$               262.00$        130.00$              

14
Deluxe Rhythm Stick Set  Top Quality Wood Sticks Half are fluted, half are plain.  Set of 

24 stick measure 14" in length and 1/2" in diameter.
2 78.00$                 156.00$        55.00$                

15 Set of 6" Brass Cymbals with Handles 2 94.00$                 188.00$        10.00$                

16 10"  tunable hand drum 10 21.00$                 210.00$        20.00$                

17 Sound Percussion Labs Bell Kit With Rolling Cart 2-1/2 OCTAVE 1 -$              200.00$              

18 Cello, 1/2 size cello Klaus Mueller etude outfit 3 698.00$               2,094.00$    500.00$              

19 Violin, 3/4 size violin. Eastman, outfit 4 -$                     -$              250.00$              

20 Remo 100 Series TU-1112-PM 12" Key-Tuned Tubano Kintekloth 2 256.00$               512.00$        225.00$              

21 Remo 100 Series TU-1114-PM 14" Key-Tuned Tubano Kintekloth 2 287.00$               574.00$        250.00$              

22 Remo 100 Series TU-1110-PM 10" Key-Tuned Tubano Kintekloth 2 281.00$               562.00$        200.00$              

23 Remo AK-4014-AH 14x40" Key-Tuned Ngoma Kinte Kloth 1 -$                     -$              400.00$              

24 Remo Mondo DJ-0014-PM 14" Key-Tuned Djembe Kintekloth 1 -$                     -$              240.00$              

25 Makala MK-S Soprano Ukulele 11 34.00$                 374.00$        40.00$                

26 Yamaha 20 Series YRS-24B Soprano Recorder 50 4.24$                   212.00$        6.00$                  

27 Sonor Primary AXP 1-1 Alto Xylophone 4 447.00$               1,788.00$    450.00$              

28 14"x28" Ludwig Concert Bass Drum – Mahogany (Model LUD-LECB28XXWF-G) 1 757.00$               757.00$        699.00$              

29 Ludwig Concert Bass Drum Stand - Tilting All-Terrain (Model LUD-LE787) 1 441.00$               441.00$        459.00$              

30 Ibanez 4 String Bass Guitar,(GSRM20BS) 1 231.00$               231.00$        150.00$              

31 Ibanez Promethean 20W 1x8 Bass Combo Amp 1 161.00$               161.00$        95.00$                

32 13 1/4" Viola Klaus Mueller Etude, outfit 2 234.00$               468.00$        295.00$              

33 14" Viola Klaus Mueller Etude, outfit 1 245.00$               245.00$        295.00$              

34 3/4 Violin Klaus Mueller Etude, outfit 1 245.00$               245.00$        250.00$              
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35 Alto Saxophone Yamaha YAS-200ADII, outfit 1 954.00$               954.00$        1,040.00$           

36 Cello, Stentor 1102 Student I Series Cello Outfit 1/2 2 -$                     -$              500.00$              

37 Viola, Stentor 1038 Student I Series Viola Outfit 12 in 1 -$                     -$              295.00$              

38 Viola, Stentor 1505 Student II Series Viola Outfit 13-in. 1 -$                     -$              295.00$              

39 Viola, Stentor 1505 Student II Series Viola Outfit 14 in. 1 -$                     -$              295.00$              

40 Cello, Stentor 1108 Student II Series Cello Outfit 3/4 Size 1 -$                     -$              500.00$              

41 Set of Basic Beat BBSL6 6" Maple Lummi Sticks, 12 Pairs 3 -$                     -$              20.00$                

42 Pair of Basic Beat BBH04 Sandblocks   25 -$                     -$              3.50$                  

43 Yamaha CGS103A  3/4 size nylon string guitar 28 -$                     -$              92.00$                

44 YAMAHA YRA-28B Alto Recorder   6 12.95$                 77.70$          15.00$                

45 Basic Beat BBH03 5 Sleigh Bells on Handle  6 -$              5.00$                  

46 Set of Boomwhackers BWCG 5-Note Chromatics Set 2 22.00$                 44.00$          15.00$                

47 Set of Boomwhackers BWKG 5-Note Bass Chromatics Set  2 34.00$                 68.00$          30.00$                

48 LP LP1-5 Standard Flexatone   1 -$              25.00$                

49 Casio CDP-S350 88-Key Digital Piano, Black  1 392.00$               392.00$        385.00$              

50 Casio SP34 3-Pedal Unit for PXS1000/CDP-S 1 75.00$                 75.00$          65.00$                

51 Westco Plastic Jingle Stick  6 6.00$                   36.00$          5.00$                  

52 Remo Kids Percussion KD-5400-01 Bongos  2 42.00$                 84.00$          35.00$                

53 Set of Remo Sound Shapes SS-3000-05 Shape Pack   1 -$                     -$              65.00$                

54 Westco 12' Parachute with 12 Handles   1 -$                     -$              40.00$                

55 The Little Old Lady Who Wasn't Afraid Of Anything With Slapstick 1 -$                     -$              

56 Musser 3.0 Octave Kelon Elite Xylophone (M42) 1 881.00$               881.00$        2,000.00$           

57 Clarinet, YCL-255 Standard Bb Clarinet (yamaha) 1 431.00$               431.00$        425.00$              

58 1/2 Size Violin--Klaus Mueller, Eastman or similar, outfit 2 194.00$               388.00$        250.00$              

59 Yamaha Yx - 230 3.0 Octave Xylophone with bag, stand and mallets 1 859.00$               859.00$        725.00$              

60 Adams AXLD35 Academy Series 3.5 Octave Light Rosewood Xylophone 1 931.00$               931.00$        850.00$              

61 Adams 3.0 Octave Academy Series Padouk Marimba 1 1,131.00$            1,131.00$    1,050.00$           

62 Tuba 3/4 size Eastman 1 -$                     -$              1,850.00$           

63 Buffet Crampon Prodige student Clarinet 1 341.00$               341.00$        365.00$              

64 Le'Var BTRLV100 Student Trumpet 1 -$                     -$              225.00$              

65 Meinl Percussion HC12PBK-M 12-Inch Conga with Basket Stand 1 -$                     -$              

66 Remo 50 series pretuned tubano 12x26 in. 1 159.00$               159.00$        150.00$              

Total Cost 235 19,668.19$         31,133.70$  25,289.50$             
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1,920.00$            2,130.00$            2,130.00$           1,926.00$            1,926.00$    

1,275.00$            1,045.00$                           1,045.00$    1,290.00$            1,290.00$           1,218.00$            1,218.00$    

1,160.00$            380.00$                              760.00$        490.00$               980.00$              478.00$               956.00$        

3,400.00$            649.00$                              1,298.00$    900.00$               1,800.00$           1,378.00$            2,756.00$    

1,275.00$            259.00$                              777.00$        360.00$               1,080.00$           355.00$               1,065.00$    

700.00$               495.00$                              495.00$        760.00$               760.00$              681.00$               681.00$        

1,250.00$            295.00$                              1,475.00$    210.00$               1,050.00$           210.00$               1,050.00$    279.00$      1,395.00$    

590.00$               349.00$                              698.00$        255.00$               510.00$              249.00$               498.00$        389.00$      778.00$        

590.00$               329.00$                              658.00$        255.00$               510.00$              249.00$               498.00$        389.00$      778.00$        

1,000.00$            -$              460.00$               920.00$              580.00$               1,160.00$    879.00$      1,758.00$    

400.00$               195.00$                              390.00$        210.00$               420.00$              150.00$               300.00$        159.00$      318.00$        

630.00$               225.00$                              450.00$        265.00$               530.00$              249.00$               249.00$        

260.00$               -$              145.00$               290.00$              128.00$               256.00$        

110.00$               72.00$                                144.00$        24.09$                 48.18$                NO BID NO BID

20.00$                 9.90$                                  19.80$          16.50$                 33.00$                NO BID NO BID

200.00$               -$              19.51$                 195.10$              NO BID NO BID

200.00$               -$              108.00$               108.00$              NO BID NO BID

1,500.00$            -$              455.00$               1,365.00$           704.00$               2,112.00$    779.00$      2,337.00$    

1,000.00$            180.00$                              720.00$        210.00$               840.00$              210.00$               840.00$        199.00$      796.00$        

450.00$               -$              175.40$               350.80$              NO BID NO BID

500.00$               -$              210.07$               420.14$              NO BID NO BID
400.00$               -$              156.03$               312.06$              NO BID NO BID

400.00$               -$              385.00$               385.00$              NO BID NO BID

240.00$               -$              180.37$               180.37$              NO BID NO BID

440.00$               -$              31.90$                 350.90$              32.00$                 352.00$        

300.00$               -$              3.99$                   199.50$              4.25$                   212.50$        

1,800.00$            -$              430.00$               1,720.00$           495.00$               1,980.00$    

699.00$               -$              900.00$               900.00$              NO BID NO BID

459.00$               -$              523.00$               523.00$              455.00$               455.00$        

150.00$               -$              129.00$               129.00$              NO BID NO BID

95.00$                 -$              95.00$                 95.00$                NO BID NO BID

590.00$               175.00$                              350.00$        255.00$               510.00$              NO BID NO BID 289.00$      578.00$        

295.00$               180.00$                              180.00$        255.00$               255.00$              386.00$               386.00$        289.00$      289.00$        

250.00$               150.00$                              150.00$        210.00$               210.00$              315.00$               315.00$        199.00$      199.00$        



1,040.00$            649.00$                              649.00$        900.00$               900.00$              885.00$               885.00$        

1,000.00$            -$              460.00$               920.00$              562.00$               1,124.00$    599.00$      1,198.00$    

295.00$               170.00$                              170.00$        255.00$               255.00$              185.00$               185.00$        189.00$      189.00$        

295.00$               170.00$                              170.00$        255.00$               255.00$              249.00$               249.00$        189.00$      189.00$        

295.00$               170.00$                              170.00$        255.00$               255.00$              249.00$               249.00$        189.00$      189.00$        

500.00$               -$              460.00$               460.00$              580.00$               580.00$        779.00$      779.00$        

60.00$                 -$              24.79$                 74.37$                NO BID NO BID

87.50$                 -$              3.54$                   88.50$                NO BID NO BID

2,576.00$            -$              89.00$                 2,492.00$           96.00$                 2,688.00$    

90.00$                 -$              14.99$                 89.94$                12.85$                 77.10$          

30.00$                 -$              3.96$                   23.76$                NO BID NO BID

30.00$                 -$              14.22$                 28.44$                12.00$                 24.00$          

60.00$                 -$              27.59$                 55.18$                23.00$                 46.00$          

25.00$                 -$              25.00$                 25.00$                25.25$                 25.25$          

385.00$               695.00$                              695.00$        360.00$               360.00$              395.00$               395.00$        

65.00$                 75.00$                                75.00$          65.00$                 65.00$                68.00$                 68.00$          

30.00$                 -$              4.78$                   28.68$                NO BID NO BID

70.00$                 -$              27.00$                 54.00$                NO BID NO BID

65.00$                 -$              58.00$                 58.00$                NO BID NO BID

40.00$                 -$              44.33$                 44.33$                NO BID NO BID

-$                     -$              NO BID -$                    NO BID NO BID

2,000.00$            -$              1,177.45$            1,177.45$           NO BID NO BID

425.00$               -$              369.00$               369.00$              435.00$               435.00$        

500.00$               150.00$                              300.00$        210.00$               420.00$              210.00$               420.00$        159.00$      318.00$        

725.00$               -$              960.00$               960.00$              855.00$               855.00$        

850.00$               -$              920.00$               920.00$              830.00$               830.00$        

1,050.00$            -$              1,325.00$            1,325.00$           1,040.00$            1,040.00$    

1,850.00$            1,695.00$                           1,695.00$    2,075.00$            2,075.00$           1,935.00$            1,935.00$    

365.00$               -$              372.69$               372.69$              335.00$               335.00$        

225.00$               220.00$                              220.00$        185.00$               185.00$              182.00$               182.00$        

-$                     147.00$               147.00$              NO BID NO BID

150.00$               124.21$               124.21$              NO BID NO BID

39,726.50$         8,981.90$                          13,753.80$  23,715.41$         36,007.60$        19,616.35$         31,892.85$  5,954.00$  12,088.00$  
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2,000.00$            2,000.00$    1,945.15$           1,945.15$        NO BID

1,177.00$            1,177.00$  1,000.00$            1,000.00$    1,189.70$           1,189.70$        NO BID

488.00$               976.00$      300.00$               600.00$        NO BID

-$            725.00$               1,450.00$    NO BID

377.00$               1,131.00$  250.00$               750.00$        NO BID

-$            690.00$               690.00$        655.50$              655.50$           NO BID

399.00$        1,995.00$    -$            400.00$               2,000.00$    NO BID

499.00$        998.00$        -$            450.00$               900.00$        NO BID

499.00$        998.00$        -$            450.00$               900.00$        NO BID

1,099.00$     2,198.00$    -$            950.00$               1,900.00$    NO BID

209.00$        418.00$        -$            400.00$               800.00$        287.55$              575.10$           NO BID

248.00$               496.00$      280.00$               560.00$        267.00$              534.00$           NO BID

104.00$               208.00$      150.00$               300.00$        130.60$              261.20$           NO BID

-$            50.00$                 100.00$        NO BID

-$            18.00$                 36.00$          NO BID

-$            45.00$                 450.00$        14.75$                 147.50$      

-$            350.00$               350.00$        NO BID

799.00$        2,397.00$    -$            750.00$               2,250.00$    NO BID

229.00$        916.00$        -$            300.00$               1,200.00$    NO BID

-$            216.00$               432.00$        251.55$              503.10$           203.15$               406.30$      

-$            253.00$               506.00$        301.30$              602.60$           245.65$               491.30$      
-$            195.00$               390.00$        223.80$              447.60$           180.20$               360.40$      

-$            440.00$               440.00$        551.95$              551.95$           432.65$               432.65$      

-$            263.00$               263.00$        316.05$              316.05$           254.15$               254.15$      

-$            45.00$                 495.00$        48.75$                536.25$           42.49$                 467.39$      

4.19$                   209.50$      5.00$                   250.00$        4.45$                  222.50$           3.91$                   195.50$      

-$            445.00$               1,780.00$    463.00$              1,852.00$        452.80$               1,811.20$  

-$            790.00$               790.00$        689.00$              689.00$           NO BID

-$            451.00$               451.00$        448.00$              448.00$           NO BID

-$            -$              195.00$              195.00$           NO BID

-$            -$              NO BID

269.00$        538.00$        -$            350.00$               700.00$        NO BID

269.00$        269.00$        -$            350.00$               350.00$        NO BID

229.00$        229.00$        -$            300.00$               300.00$        NO BID



888.00$               888.00$      725.00$               725.00$        NO BID

699.00$        1,398.00$    -$            750.00$               1,500.00$    NO BID

219.00$        219.00$        -$            350.00$               350.00$        NO BID

219.00$        219.00$        -$            350.00$               350.00$        NO BID

219.00$        219.00$        -$            350.00$               350.00$        NO BID

699.00$        699.00$        -$            750.00$               750.00$        NO BID

-$            36.00$                 108.00$        14.32$                 42.96$        

-$            4.00$                   100.00$        5.90$                   147.50$      

119.00$        3,332.00$    -$            -$              118.99$               3,331.72$  

12.95$                 77.70$        17.00$                 102.00$        13.35$                80.10$             14.58$                 87.48$        

-$            12.00$                 72.00$          4.00$                   24.00$        

-$            19.00$                 38.00$          14.04$                 28.08$        

-$            40.00$                 80.00$          23.36$                 46.72$        

-$            30.00$                 30.00$          28.00$                28.00$             28.89$                 28.89$        

-$            495.00$               495.00$        519.00$               519.00$      

-$            90.00$                 90.00$          89.99$                 89.99$        

-$            6.00$                   36.00$          5.06$                   30.36$        

-$            35.00$                 70.00$            32.30$                 64.60$        

-$            62.00$                 62.00$          81.00$                81.00$             63.31$                 63.31$        

-$            -$              36.51$                 36.51$        

-$            -$              20.55$                 20.55$        

-$            896.00$               896.00$        894.00$              894.00$           NO BID

377.00$               377.00$      250.00$               250.00$        357.85$              357.85$           NO BID

229.00$        458.00$        -$            300.00$               600.00$        NO BID

819.00$               819.00$      -$              820.50$              820.50$           NO BID

777.00$               777.00$      832.00$               832.00$        791.20$              791.20$           NO BID

977.00$               977.00$      1,778.00$            1,778.00$    1,690.75$           1,690.75$        NO BID

2,350.00$            2,350.00$    NO BID

344.00$               344.00$        329.85$              329.85$           NO BID

250.00$               250.00$        NO BID

-$              195.00$              195.00$           NO BID

162.00$               162.00$        178.15$              178.15$           143.65$               143.65$      

6,903.00$     17,500.00$  6,249.14$           8,113.20$  24,944.00$         38,153.00$  13,348.00$        16,971.10$     2,964.20$           9,271.71$  


