City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Texas Enterprises Inc. dba Golden West
. ) ) Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd. Arnold Oil of San Antonio Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) Oil Co. Hampel Oil Distributor Inc.
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 2375 Walsh Rd 8423 Easton 6374 Rittiman Rd 3010 Aniol St. 1245 N West St.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Wichita,
6100013891 CD TX 78224 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78219 KS 67203
Item Description
Estimated
Annual Usage |
1 LUBRICANTS
MIL-PRF-2I05E Extreme Pressure Gear Lube,
SAE Grade 85W-140
1a 400Ib. Drum, price per Ib. 14,0000 Ibs.
Unit Price $1.84 $2.47 $1.70 $2.11 $1.57
Extended Price $25,766.00 $34,592.35 $23,800.00 $29,540.00 $22,018.85
Product Name P66MPGL85W40 HD GEAR OIL 85W 140 GEAR OIL MOBIL LUBE HD PLUS 85W 140 PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD 85W-140
Product Number 841169 PUR 85W-140D 102517 105440
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE PURUS MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANT
1b 120 Ib. drum, price per Ib. 700 Ibs.
Unit Price NO BID $2.55 $1.73 $2.51 $2.25
Extended Price $1,785.00 $1,211.00 $1,757.00 $1,574.77
Product Name HD GEAR OIL 85W 140 GEAR OIL MOBIL LUBE HD PLUS 85W 140 PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD 85W-140
Product Number 817738 PUR 85W-140K 102516 109476
Manufacturer VALVOLINE PURUS MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANT
High Temperature Grease, MYSTIC JT-6, Material
Code 665005002
1c 400Ib. Drum, price per Ib. 3,000 Ibs.
Unit Price $2.86 $3.09 $3.92 $2.55 $3.18
Extended Price $8,580.00 $9,270.00 $11,760.00 $7,650.00 $9,544.80
Product Name MULTIPLEX 600#2 JT-6 GREASE MYSTIK JT6 MYSTIK JT-6 HT EP GREASE #2 MYSTIK JT-6 HIGH-TEMP 2
Product Number 7086 JT6 665005002020 105642
Manufacturer P66 MYSTIK MYSTIK CITGO MYSTIK CITGO
1d 120 Ib. drum, price per Ib. 1,000 Ibs.
Unit Price $2.98 $3.15 $3.95 $2.55 $3.28
Extended Price $2,980.00 $3,150.00 $3,950.00 $2,550.00 $3,281.67
Product Name MULTIPLEX 600#2 JT-6 GREASE MYSTIK JT6 MYSTIK JT-6 HT EP GREASE #2 MYSTIK JT-6 HIGH-TEMP 2
Product Number 7085 JT6 665005002070 105036
Manufacturer P66 MYSTIK MYSTIK CITGO MYSTIK CITGO
1e 16-oune tube, price per tube 100 tubes
Unit Price $2.73 $3.07 $2.75 $2.65 $3.32
Extended Price $273.00 $307.00 $275.00 $265.00 $331.60
Product Name MULTIPLEX 600#2 JT-6 GREASE MYSTIK JT6 MYSTIK JT-6 HT EP GREASE #2 MYSTIK JT-6 HIGH-TEMP 2
Product Number 7080 665005-0020080 665005002080 102896
Manufacturer P66 MYSTIK MYSTIK CITGO MYSTIK CITGO
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
1f. 1-gallon pail, price per gallon 100 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $1.32 $5.19 $3.89 NO BID
Extended Price $132.00 $519.00 $389.00
Product Name DEF BULK DEF BLUE DEF PEAK
Product Number DEFB DEF002 DEF-DEF003
Manufacturer OLD WORLD BLUE DEF OLD WORLD
1g. 2.5 -gallon container, price per gallon 5,000 gallons
Unit Price $3.32 $3.29 $7.99 $2.68 $3.54
Extended Price $41,500.00 $16,450.00 $39,950.00 $13,400.00 $44,200.00
Product Name
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID DEF 2.5 GAL DEF GOLDEN WEST DEF HAMPEL DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID
Product Number DEF-25G NPF002 EF 601-002 107582
Manufacturer OLD WORLD NAPA MUSKET CORP. BLUE SKY
Extra High Performance Automotive Gear
Lubricant, 85W-90, or Proven Equal
1h. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 25 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $5.61 $7.54 NO BID NO BID
Extended Price $188.50
Product Name HP GEAR OIL 80W90 NAPA GEAR OIL
Product Number VV831 (80W90) ONLY AVAILABLE 75210
Manufacturer VALVOLINE NAPA
Sub-total for Iltem 1: $188.50 $80,951.69
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Matori Industries, Inc.
) ) ) Hays City Corp dbaTex-Con Qil Co. HJDJ American Lube Supply Inc Gonzales Auto Parts 404 E Sonterra Blvd
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 4906 Burleson Rd 8165 Whisper Oak 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Ste 375
Austin, San Antonio, Lardeo, San Antonio,
6100013891 CD TX 78744 TX 78266 TX 78041 TX 78258
Item Description
Estimated
Annual Usage |
1 LUBRICANTS
MIL-PRF-2I05E Extreme Pressure Gear Lube,
SAE Grade 85W-140
1a 400Ib. Drum, price per Ib. 14,0000 Ibs.
Unit Price $1.78 $1.53 N/A $1,979.80
Extended Price $24,920.00 $21,408.06 $69,293.00
Product Name MP GEAR LUBE 85W140 1/55 BEL RAY MULTI-FILM 80W140
Product Number 402191 30223-003 0020-80140-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
1b 120 Ib. drum, price per Ib. 700 Ibs.
Unit Price NO BID $1.76 N/A $835.12
Extended Price $1,232.00 $4,175.00
Product Name BEL RAY MULTI-FILM 80W140
Product Number CALUMET 0020-80140-4, 20-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
High Temperature Grease, MYSTIC JT-6, Material
Code 665005002
1c 400Ib. Drum, price per Ib. 3,000 Ibs.
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $3,400.84
Extended Price $25,506.00
Product Name HYDRO-SYN 70 #2
Product Number 0070-2-2, 55 GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
1d 120 Ib. drum, price per Ib. 1,000 Ibs.
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $1,015.01
Extended Price $8,424.00
Product Name HYDRO-SYN 70 #2
Product Number 0070-2-5; 16-GALLON KEG
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
1e 16-oune tube, price per tube 100 tubes
Unit Price NO BID NO BID $3.89 $396.11
Extended Price $389.00 $1,185.33
Product Name JT-6 HIGH TEMP GREASE (14 0z) HYDRO-SYN 70 #2
Product Number 665005002080 0070-2-9, 36-14 oz CARTRIDGES
Manufacturer MYSTIK HYDROTEX
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
1f. 1-gallon pail, price per gallon 100 gallons
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $9.51
Extended Price $951.00
Product Name PEAK
Product Number DEF003
Manufacturer PEAK
19. 2.5 -gallon container, price per gallon 5,000 gallons
Unit Price $3.99 $6.89 $12.32 $12.38
Extended Price $19,950.00 $34,450.00 $61,600.00 $61,900.00
Product Name
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID 1/2.5 QUALITY DEF SOLUTIONS| 2.5 GALLON DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID KLEEN DEF
Product Number 702353 DEF 2.5 16106 KLF002-GR
Manufacturer QUALITY DEF SOULTIONS QUALITY DIESEL KLEEN KLEEN
Extra High Performance Automotive Gear
Lubricant, 85W-90, or Proven Equal
1h. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 25 quarts
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $287.76
Extended Price $575.52
Product Name MULTI-FILM 80Q90
Product Number 0020-8090-6, 6-1 GALLON CASE
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
Sub-total for Item 1: $44,870.00 $61,989.00 $575.52
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Texas Enterprises Inc. dba Golden West
. ) ) Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd. Arnold Oil of San Antonio Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) Oil Co. Hampel Oil Distributor Inc.
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 2375 Walsh Rd 8423 Easton 6374 Rittiman Rd 3010 Aniol St. 1245 N West St.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Wichita,
6100013891 CD TX 78224 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78219 KS 67203
2 MOTOR OIL
Premium Synthetic Blend Motor Oil, GF-5, SAE
Grade 5W-20, or Proven Equal
2a. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 11,000 gallons
Unit Price $9.09 $9.96 $6.62 $6.77 $6.19
Extended Price $99,990.00 $109,560.00 $72,820.00 $74,470.00 $68,090.00
Product Name 5W20 SYN BLEND MOBIL SPECIAL 5W20 PATRIOT SUPERSHIELD SYN-BLD
SHIELD CHOICE 5W20 BLEND BULK 5W20 5W20
Product Number VV1740 T55W20B 124518 101233
Manufacturer P66 VAVOLINE TECH SELECT MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANT
2b. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,.500 gallons
Unit Price $10.09 $11.16 $6.62 $8.45 $6.64
Extended Price $15,135.00 $16,740.00 $9,930.00 $12,675.00 $9,960.00
Product Name PATRIOT SUPERSHIELD SYN-BLD
SHIELD CHOICE 5W20 BLEND 5W20 5W20 SYNTHETIC BLEND MOBIL SPECIAL 5W20 5W20
Product Number VV110 T55W20B 124399 105234
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE TECH SELECT MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANT
Motor Oil, SAE 30, or Proven Equal
2c. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,900 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $12.64 $10.10 $10.38 $13.79
Extended Price $24,016.00 $19,190.00 $19,722.00 $26,192.71
Product Name ALT FLEET 30W 30w GOLDEN WEST SERIES 30WT CITGARD 600 SAE 30
Product Number VV393 75127 46077310949 105065
Manufacturer VALVOLINE NAPA WARREN OIL CITGO
Motor Oil, 15W40 CJ-4 Valvoline Premium Blue
GEO #70520. or Proven Equal
2d. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 10,000 gallons
Unit Price $10.71 $13.03 $7.99 $14.12 $7.69
Extended Price $107,100.00 $130,300.00 $79,900.00 $141,200.00 $76,900.00
Product Name GUARDOL NG 15W40 PB15W40 15W40)BIL DELVAC MODERN ENG/LNG 15W40]ATRIOT ULTRASHIELD FLT 15W-40 CK4
Product Number 891011 125397 114888
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE PURUS MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANT
Ze. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 30,000 gallons
Unit Price $9.71 $11.83 $7.99 $9.98 $7.24
Extended Price $2,911,300.00 $354,900.00 $239,700.00 $299,400.00 $217,200.00
Product Name GUARDOL NG 15W40 PB 15W40 15W40)BIL DELVAC MODERN ENG/LNG 15W40lATRIOT ULTRASHIELD FLT 15W-40 CK4
Product Number 891001 125398 114878
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE PURUS MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANT
Motor Oil, SAE Grade 10W-40, or Proven Equal
2f. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 75 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $4.55 $3.15 $5.11 NO BID
Extended Price $341.25 $236.25 $383.25
Product Name 10W40 10W40 MOBIL SPECIAL 10W40
Product Number 797671 75100 124398
Manufacturer VALVOLINE NAPA MOBIL
2g. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 150 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $19.44 NO BID
Extended Price $2,916.00
Product Name MOBIL SPECIAL 10W40
Product Number 112920
Manufacturer NO PRODUCT MOBIL
Full Synthetic Motor Oil, SAE Grade 0W-20 (Must
meet Honda Hybrid APl SM Specifications), or
Proven Equal
2h. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 700 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $15.48 $10.61 $8.33
Extended Price $10,836.00 $7,427.00 $5,831.00
Product Name FULL SYN 0W20 SYN 0wW20 PATRIOT SSOW-20 DEXOS 1 GEN 2
Product Number 881494 123083 114885
Manufacturer VALVOLINE MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANT
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Matori Industries, Inc.
) ) ) Hays City Corp dbaTex-Con Qil Co. HJDJ American Lube Supply Inc Gonzales Auto Parts 404 E Sonterra Blvd
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 4906 Burleson Rd 8165 Whisper Oak 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Ste 375
Austin, San Antonio, Lardeo, San Antonio,
6100013891 CD TX 78744 TX 78266 TX 78041 TX 78258
2 MOTOR OIL
Premium Synthetic Blend Motor Oil, GF-5, SAE
Grade 5W-20, or Proven Equal
2a. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 11,000 gallons
Unit Price $8.05 $6.29 N/A $7,688.10
Extended Price $88,550.00 $69,190.00 $307,524.00
Product Name SHIELD CHOICE 5W20 BULK BEL RAY HYFILM LEO EPG 5W20
Product Number 402140 30228-000 0018-250-1, 275-GALLON TOTE
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
2b. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,.500 gallons
Unit Price $8.56 $8.54 N/A $1,456.66
Extended Price $12,840.00 $12,810.00 $39,313.00
Product Name HYFILM LEO EPG 5W20
SHIELD CHOICE 5W20 1/55 BEL RAY
Product Number 402141 302228-007 00118-520-5, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
Motor Qil, SAE 30, or Proven Equal
2c. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,900 gallons
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $1,298.37
Extended Price $45,442.00
Product Name HYFILM SUPREME SAE 30, API CI-4/SM EQUIVELANT
Product Number 0005-30-1, 275-GALLON TOTE
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
Motor Oil, 15W40 CJ-4 Valvoline Premium Blue
GEO #70520. or Proven Equal
2d. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 10,000 gallons
Unit Price $7.85 $10.93 N/A $1,207.74
Extended Price $78,500.00 $109,300.00 $219,808.00
Product Name FLEET EC15W40 1/55 DIESALL NG15W40 HYFILM LEO HD 15W40, API CK-4
Product Number 403001 0012-1540-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 DRYDENE HYDROTEX
2e. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 30,000 gallons
Unit Price $7.35 $9.93 N/A $6,038.72
Extended Price $220,500.00 $297,900.00 $658,220.00
Product Name FLEET EC 15W40 BULK DIESALL NG15W40 HYFILM LEO HD 15W40, API CK-4
Product Number 403000 D2315401 0012-1540-1, 275-GALLON TOTE
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 DRYDENE HYDROTEX
Motor Oil, SAE Grade 10W-40, or Proven Equal
2f. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 75 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $2.46 N/A $84.80
Extended Price $184.50 $530.00
Product Name BEL RAY HYFILM LEO HD 15W40, API CK-4
Product Number 302236-0125 0012-1540-14, 12/1 QUART CASE
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
2g9. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 150 gallons
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $135.16
Extended Price $4,054.80
Product Name HYFILM LEO HD 15W40, API CK-4
Product Number 0012-1540-8, 5-GALLON PAIL
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
Full Synthetic Motor Qil, SAE Grade 0W-20 (Must
meet Honda Hybrid APl SM Specifications), or
Proven Equal
2h. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 700 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $9.04 N/A $1,267.00
Extended Price $6,238.00 $16,471.00
Product Name BEL RAY VALVOLINE FULL SYNTHETIC
Product Number 301239-000 805783
Manufacturer CALUMET VALVOLINE
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Texas Enterprises Inc. dba Golden West
. ] ] Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd. Arnold Qil of San Antonio Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) Qil Co. Hampel Oil Distributor Inc.
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 2375 Walsh Rd 8423 Easton 6374 Rittiman Rd 3010 Aniol St. 1245 N West St.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Wichita,
6100013891 CD TX 78224 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78219 KS 67203
Full Synthetic Motor Oil, SAE Grade 30 (Must
Meet Toyota Hybrid APl SM Specifications), or
Proven Equal
2i. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 700 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $20.32 $10.61 $8.33
Extended Price $14,224.00 $7,427.00 $5,831.00
Product Name
SYN POWER 5W30 MOBIL SUPER PATRIOT SS 5W-30 DEXOS 1 GEN 2
Product Number VV915 SYN 5W30 114886
Manufacturer VALVOLINE 113937 MARTIN LUBRICANTS
MOBIL
2j. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 70 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $18.72 $10.33
Extended Price $1,310.10 $723.10
Product Name
MOBIL SUPER SYN 5W30 PATRIOT SS 5W-30 DEXOS 1 GEN 2
Product Number 124115 999999
Manufacturer NO PRODUCT MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
Gear Lube Synthetic for Differentials, SAE Grade
75W-90, or Proven Equal
2k. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 3,000 gallons
Unit Price $30.61 $35.15 $24.04 $16.60
Extended Price $91,830.00 $105,420.00 $72,120.00 $49,800.00
Product Name TRITEN SYN FE 75W90 SYNGEAR 75W90 MOBIL DELVAC 1 75W90| PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD SYN 75W-90
Product Number VV70026 122046 105741
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
2l. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 75 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $37.53 $38.59 $18.60
Extended Price $2,814.75 $2,894.25 $1,395.00
Product Name SYNGEAR 75W90 MOBIL DELVAC 1 75W90| PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD SYN 75W-90
Product Number VV700285M 122047 104559
Manufacturer VALVOLINE MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
Synthetic Gear Lubricant, SAE Grade 80W-140,
Castrol Syngear, or Proven Equal
2m. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price $30.61 $34.09 $33.20 $27.55
Extended Price $15,305.00 $17,045.00 $16,600.00 $13,776.55
Product Name TRITEN SYN FF 80W140 SYNGEAR 80W140 MOBIL DELVAC 1 80W140 CITGEAR HD SYNTHETIC 80W-140
Product Number S80140D 122036 109044
Manufacturer P66 CASTROL HD MOBIL CITGO
2n. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 70 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $34.53 $34.60 $41.79 $29.16
Extended Price $2,417.10 $2,422.00 $2,925.30 $2,040.90
Product Name SYNGEAR 80W140 80W140 MOBIL DELVAC 1 80W40 CITGEAR HD SYNTHETIC 80W-140
Product Number S80140p 700-475M 122040 109457
Manufacturer CASTROL HD VALVOLINE MOBIL CITGO
Synthetic Motor Oil, SAE Grade 15-50 Mobil-1, or
Proven Equal
20. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 150 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $7.96 $7.11 $7.14 NO BID
Extended Price $1,194.00 $1,066.52 $1,071.00
Product Name SYN 15W50 15W50 MOBIL 1 15W50
Product Number S$1550Q 122377 122377
Manufacturer MOBIL MOBIL 1 MOBIL
API CJ-4 Diesel Engine Oil, 15W-40, or Proven
Equal
2p. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 16,000 gallons
Unit Price $8.46 $9.93 $7.99 $7.08 $7.24
Extended Price $13,530.00 $158,880.00 $127,840.00 $113,280.00 $115,840.00
Product Name GUARDOL FLEET EC 15W40 ALL TERRAIN 15W40 15W40 MOBIL DELVAC HDEO 15W40[ATRIOT ULTRASHIELD FLT 15W-40 CK4
Product Number 892873 125152 114878
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE PURUS MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Matori Industries, Inc.
] ] ] Hays City Corp dbaTex-Con Qil Co. HJDJ American Lube Supply Inc Gonzales Auto Parts 404 E Sonterra Blvd
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 4906 Burleson Rd 8165 Whisper Oak 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Ste 375
Austin, San Antonio, Lardeo, San Antonio,
6100013891 CD TX 78744 TX 78266 TX 78041 TX 78258
Full Synthetic Motor Oil, SAE Grade 30 (Must
Meet Toyota Hybrid APl SM Specifications), or
Proven Equal
2i. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 700 gallons
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $1,375.00
Extended Price $17,875.00
Product Name PERFORMANCE PLUS 5W-30 FULL
SYNTHETIC
Product Number
Manufacturer PERFORMANCE PLUS
2j. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 70 gallons
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $105.00
Extended Price $1,470.00
Product Name ULTRAPLUS 5W-30 SYNTHETIC BLEND
MOTOR OIL, APl SN PLUS | 5 GALLON
PAIL
Product Number
Manufacturer ULTRA 1 PLUS
Gear Lube Synthetic for Differentials, SAE Grade
75W-90, or Proven Equal
2k. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 3,000 gallons
Unit Price $24.99 $18.21 N/A $2,192.30
Extended Price $74,970.00 $54,630.00 $120,576.00
Product Name TRITON SYN GL 75W90 1/400 BEL RAY HYDRO-SYN EP 75W90
Product Number 403061 3022421-000 0027-7590-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
2I. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 75 gallons
Unit Price $29.99 $19.41 N/A $229.20
Extended Price $2,249.25 $1,455.75 $3,208.80
Product Name TRITON SYN GL 75W90 1/35 BEL RAY HYDRO-SYN EP 75W90
Product Number 403062 3022421-019 0027-7590-8, 5-GALLON PAIL
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
Synthetic Gear Lubricant, SAE Grade 80W-140,
Castrol Syngear, or Proven Equal
2m. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price $24.99 $34.09 N/A $2,066.91
Extended Price $12,495.00 $17,045.00 $18,602.00
Product Name TRITON SYN GL 80W140 1/400 CASTROL SYNGEAR MULTI-FILM 80W140
Product Number 403051 15B812 0020-80140-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CASTROL HYDROTEX
2n. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 70 gallons
Unit Price $29.99 $35.09 N/A $218.27
Extended Price $2,099.90 $2,456.30 $3,055.78
Product Name TRITON SYN GL 80W140 1/35 CASTROL SYNGEAR MULTI-FILM 80W140
Product Number 403052 15B811 0020-80140-8, 5GALLON PAIL
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CASTROL HYDROTEX
Synthetic Motor Oil, SAE Grade 15-50 Mobil-1, or
Proven Equal
20. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 150 quarts
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $179.76
Extended Price $2,247.00
Product Name TEAM RACING MOTOR OIL 15W50
Product Number 0052-1550-14, 12-32 0z.CASE
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
API CJ-4 Diesel Engine Oil, 15W-40, or Proven
Equal
2p. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 16,000 gallons
Unit Price $7.35 $7.60 N/A $6,038.72
Extended Price $117,600.00 $121,600.00 $350,245.00
Product Name FLEET EC 15W40 BULK TRX 15W40 HYFILM LEO 15W40 HD, API CK-4
Product Number 403000 T2115401 00-1540-1, 275-GALLON TOTE
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 DRYDENE HYDROTEX
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Texas Enterprises Inc. dba Golden West
. ) ) Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd. Arnold Oil of San Antonio Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) Qil Co. Hampel Qil Distributor Inc.
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 2375 Walsh Rd 8423 Easton 6374 Rittiman Rd 3010 Aniol St. 1245 N West St.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Wichita,
6100013891 CD TX 78224 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78219 KS 67203
Full Synthetic Motor Oil, European, 0W-40, or
Proven Equal
2q. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 900 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $28.50 $35.45 $16.90 NO BID
Extended Price $25,650.00 $31,905.00 $15,210.00
Product Name
SYN 0W40 0wW40 MOBIL 1 0W40
Product Number S040D 105-623 105623
Manufacturer MOBIL MOBIL 1 MOBIL
Full Synthetic Motor Oil, 0W40, or Proven Equal
2r. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 600 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $28.50 $16.90 NO BID
Extended Price $17,100.00 $10,140.00
Product Name SYN 0W40 MOBIL 1 0W40
Product Number S040D 105623
Manufacturer MOBIL MOBIL
Synthetic Motor Oil, SAE 5W-40, or Proven Equal
2s. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1, 200 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $19.45 $30.18 $16.25 $22.05
Extended Price $23,340.00 $36,216.00 $19,500.00 $26,457.25
Product Name SYN POWER 5w40 5W40 SYN MOBIL SUPER SYN 5W40|CITGUARD SYNDURANCE PLUS 5W-40
Product Number VV929 5500-46219 124838 105719
Manufacturer VALVOLINE SHELL ROTELLA MOBIL CITGO
Ultra Platinum Full Synthetic Motor Oil, 0W-40,
or Proven Equal
2t. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 3,000 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $28.50 $16.90 NO BID
Extended Price $85,500.00 $50,700.00
Product Name SYN 0W40 MOBIL 1 0OW10
Product Number S040D 105623
Manufacturer MOBIL MOBIL
Conventional Motor Oil, 10W-30, or Proven
Equal
2u. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,700 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $11.16 $9.09 $8.37 $6.64
Extended Price $18,972.00 $15,453.00 $14,229.00 $11,288.00
Product Name 10W30 10W30 GOLDEN WEST 10W301I0OT SUPERSHIELD SYN-BLEND 10W-30
Product Number VV124 75134 04607131062L 105325
Manufacturer VALVOLINE NAPA WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
Sub-total for Iltem 2: $744,541.40 $631,625.53
3 INDUSTRIAL OILS
Hydraulic Oil, ISO Grade 32, or Proven Equal 3,000 gallons
3a. Bulk (transport),price per gallon
Unit Price $7.05 $7.21 $5.75 $6.67 $5.35
Extended Price $21,150.00 $21,630.00 $17,250.00 $20,010.00 $16,050.00
Product Name MEGALFOWAW HYD 32 HYD OIL ISO 32 AW32 GOLDEN WEST AW32 PATRIOT HYDRASHIELD AW-32
Product Number AW32B TSAW32B 46077410168 101093
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON TECH SELECT WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
3b. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,000 gallons
Unit Price $8.05 $8.41 $5.75 $6.79 $5.80
Extended Price $8,050.00 $8,410.00 $5,750.00 $6,790.00 $5,800.00
Product Name MEGALFOWAW HYD 32 HYD OIL ISO 32 AW32 GOLDEN WEST AW32 PATRIOT HYDRASHIELD AW-32
Product Number AW32D TSAW32B 46077410673 105172
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON TECH SELECT WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
CITGO Hydraulic Fluid AW68 (Non-Conductive),
Megaflow AW HVI Hydraulic Oil, or Proven Equal
3c. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 900 gallons
Unit Price $18.69 $8.55 $22.50 $12.79
Extended Price $16,821.00 $7,695.00 $20,250.00 $11,511.82
Product Name MEGAFLOW AW HYD 68 HYD OIL ISO 68 MOBIL DTE 10 EXCEL 58 CITGO
Product Number AWG8D 106130 9999999
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL CITGO
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Matori Industries, Inc.
] ] ] Hays City Corp dbaTex-Con Qil Co. HJDJ American Lube Supply Inc Gonzales Auto Parts 404 E Sonterra Blvd
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 4906 Burleson Rd 8165 Whisper Oak 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Ste 375
Austin, San Antonio, Lardeo, San Antonio,
6100013891 CD TX 78744 TX 78266 TX 78041 TX 78258
Full Synthetic Motor QOil, European, 0W-40, or
Proven Equal
2q. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 900 gallons
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $2,142.00
Extended Price $36,414.00
Product Name MOBIL 1 0W-40 100% SYNTHETIC, 55-
GALLON DRUM
Product Number
Manufacturer
Full Synthetic Motor Oil, 0W40, or Proven Equal
2r. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 600 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $23.56 N/A $1,537.62
Extended Price $14,137.50 $16,913.82
Product Name EDGE 0W40 A3/B4 HYFILM LEO 5W40, API CK-5
Product Number 15544B8 0012-540-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer CASTROL HYDROTEX
Synthetic Motor Oil, SAE 5W-40, or Proven Equal
2s. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1, 200 gallons
Unit Price $19.55 $16.48 N/A $1,537.62
Extended Price $23,460.00 $19,776.00 $33,827.00
Product Name ROTELLA T6 5W40 1/55 BEL RAY HYFILM LEO 5W40, API CK-5
Product Number 550046219 0012-540-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer SHELL CALUMET HYDROTEX
Ultra Platinum Full Synthetic Motor Oil, 0W-40,
or Proven Equal
2t. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 3,000 gallons
Unit Price $28.75 NO BID N/A $1,357.62
Extended Price $86,250.00 84.569.10
Product Name PENZOIL ULT PLT OW40 1/55 HYFILM LEO 5W40, APl CK-5
Product Number 550040846 0012-540-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PENNZOIL/SHELL HYDROTEX
Conventional Motor Oil, 10W-30, or Proven
Equal
2u. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,700 gallons
Unit Price $9.20 $9.04 N/A $1,207.74
Extended Price $15,640.00 $15,368.00 $37,439.94
Product Name GUARDOL ECT 10W30 1/55 BEL RAY BRX SYN BLEND HYFILM LEO 10W30, APl CK-4
Product Number 404001 302235-007 0012-1030-22, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
Sub-total for Iltem 2: $735,103.55 N/A $37,439.94
3 INDUSTRIAL OILS
Hydraulic Oil, ISO Grade 32, or Proven Equal 3,000 gallons
3a. Bulk (transport),price per gallon
Unit Price $5.99 $6.09 N/A $4,917.97
Extended Price $17,970.00 $18,282.35 $54,097.87
Product Name MEGAFLOW AW HYD 32 BULK BEL RAY PREMIUM AW 4Kz 1SO 32
Product Number 502210 302123-000 0217-032-1, 275-GALLON TOTE
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
3b. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,000 gallons
Unit Price $6.49 $7.09 N/A $963.59
Extended Price $6,490.00 $7,090.00 $18,688.21
Product Name MEGAFLOW AW HYD 32 1/55 BEL RAY 4Kz I1SO 32
Product Number 502211 0217-032-2, 275-GALLON TOTE
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
CITGO Hydraulic Fluid AW68 (Non-Conductive),
Megaflow AW HVI Hydraulic Oil, or Proven Equal
3c. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 900 gallons
Unit Price $6.49 $9.71 N/A $2,196.17
Extended Price $5,841.00 $8,766.00 $37,334.89
Product Name MEGAFLOW AW HVI 68 1/55 PARADENE AW68 SYN-NTH HYDRAULIC FLUID ISO 68
Product Number 502411 14A385 0255-068-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CASTROL HYDROTEX
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Texas Enterprises Inc. dba Golden West
. ) ) Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd. Arnold Oil of San Antonio Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) Qil Co. Hampel Qil Distributor Inc.
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 2375 Walsh Rd 8423 Easton 6374 Rittiman Rd 3010 Aniol St. 1245 N West St.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Wichita,
6100013891 CD TX 78224 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78219 KS 67203
3d. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 850 quarts
Unit Price NO BID NO BID NO BID
Extended Price
Product Name
Product Number
Manufacturer NO PRODUCT
All Season Hydraulic Oil HYD46
3e. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 2,500 gallons $6.67 $6.30
Unit Price $8.05 $8.41 $16,675.00 $15,750.00
Extended Price $20,125.00 $21,025.00 GOLDEN WEST AW 46 PATRIOT HYDRASHIELD AW-46
Product Name MEGAFLOW AW HYD 46 HYD OIL ISO 46 46071310628 105167
Product Number SW46D WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON
10 Weight Hydraulic Oil, or Proven Equal
3f. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 600 gallons
Unit Price $8.05 $12.60 $18.69 NO BID
Extended Price $4,830.00 $7,560.00 $11,214.00
Product Name MEGAFLOW AW HYD 22 1000 THF MOBIL HYDRAULIC 10WT.
Product Number THFD 103164
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL
39. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 50 gallons
Unit Price $9.55 $13.40 $12.80 $19.60 NO BID
Extended Price $477.50 $670.00 $640.00 $980.00
Product Name MEGAFLOW AW HYD 22 1000 THF R70 MOBIL HYDRAULIC 10WT.
Product Number THFP 85105 103165
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON NAPA MOBIL
API CK-4 Diesel Engine Oil, or Proven Equal
3h. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 20,000 gallons
Unit Price $8.46 $9.93 $7.99 $7.08 $7.24
Extended Price $169,200.00 $198,600.00 $159,800.00 $141,600.00 $144,800.00
Product Name GUARDOL FLEET EC 15W40 ALL TERRAIN 15W40 15W40 MOBIL DELVAC HDEO 15W40|ATRIOT ULTRASHIELD FLT 15W-40 CK4
Product Number 892873 125152 114878
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE PURUS MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
3i. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 6,000 gallons
Unit Price $9.46 $9.77 $7.99 $9.76 $7.69
Extended Price $56,760.00 $58,620.00 $47,940.00 $58,560.00 $46,140.00
Product Name GUARDOL FLEET EC 15W40 ALL TERRAIN 15W40 15W40 MOBIL DELVAC HDEO 15W40|ATRIOT ULTRASHIELD FLT 15W-40 CK4
Product Number 894063 125150 114888
Manufacturer P66 VALVOLINE PURUS MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
3j. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 1,000 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $4.87 $2.90 $5.50 NO BID
Extended Price $4,870.00 $2,900.00 $5,500.00
Product Name DELO 15W40 15W40 MOBIL DELVAC 15W40
Product Number 1540CKQ 75123 122494
Manufacturer CHEVRON NAPA MOBIL
Sub-total for Item 3: $210,640.00 $281,579.00 $240,051.82
4 TRANSMISSION FLUID
Genuine Universal Tractor Hydraulic Oil SB-00,
or Proven Equal
4a. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 2,000 gallons
Unit Price $8.84 $12.60 $7.43 $6.17
Extended Price $17,680.00 $25,200.00 $14,860.00 $12,340.00
Product Name POWERTRAN 1000 THF MOBIL 424| PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TRACTOR HDY
Product Number THFD 100979 105049
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
4b. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 75 gallons
Unit Price $10.34 $13.40 $10.55 $8.17
Extended Price $775.50 $1,005.00 $791.25 $612.75
Product Name POWERTRAN 1000 THF MOBIL 424| PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TRACTOR HDY
Product Number THFP 100978 103330
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Matori Industries, Inc.
] ] ] Hays City Corp dbaTex-Con Qil Co. HJDJ American Lube Supply Inc Gonzales Auto Parts 404 E Sonterra Blvd
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 4906 Burleson Rd 8165 Whisper Oak 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Ste 375
Austin, San Antonio, Lardeo, San Antonio,
6100013891 CD TX 78744 TX 78266 TX 78041 TX 78258
3d. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 850 quarts
Unit Price NO BID NO BID N/A $239.58
Extended Price $10,182.15
Product Name SYN-NTH HYDRAULIC FLUID ISO 68
Product Number 0255-068-6, 6/1-GALLON CASE
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
All Season Hydraulic Oil HYD46
3e. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 2,500 gallons $6.49 $6.09 N/A $2,196.17
Unit Price $16,255.00 $15,225.00 $101,023.82
Extended Price MEGAFLOW AW HYD46 1/55 BEL RAY PREMIUM AW46 SYN-NTH HYDRAULIC FLUID ISO 46
Product Name 502221 3021245-000 0255-046-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Product Number PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
Manufacturer
10 Weight Hydraulic Oil, or Proven Equal
3f. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 600 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $9.98 N/A $963.59
Extended Price $5,988.00 $10,619.49
Product Name BEL RAY 4Kz 1SO 32
Product Number TO4-10 0217-032-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer 3023021-007 HYDROTEX
CALUMET
3g. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 50 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $10.98 N/A $107.30
Extended Price $549.00 $1,073.00
Product Name BEL RAY TO4-10 4Kz ISO 32
Product Number 3023021-017 0217-032-8, 5-GALLON PAIL
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
API CK-4 Diesel Engine Oil, or Proven Equal
3h. Bulk (transport),price per gallon 20,000 gallons
Unit Price $7.35 $7.60 N/A $6,038.72
Extended Price $147,000.00 $152,000.00 $440,826.56
Product Name FLEET EC 15W40 BULK TRX 15W40 HYFILM LEO HD 15W40, API CK-4
Product Number 403000 T2115401 0012-1540-1, 275-GALLON TOTE
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 DRYDENE HYDROTEX
3i. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 6,000 gallons
Unit Price $7.85 $8.70 N/A $1,207.74
Extended Price $47,100.00 $52,200.00 $131,643.66
Product Name FLEET ED 15W40 1/55 TRX 15W40 HYFILM LEO HD 15W40, API CK-4
Product Number 403001 0012-1540-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 DRYDENE HYDROTEX
3j. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 1,000 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $3.19 N/A $84.80
Extended Price $3,190.00 $7,038.40
Product Name TRX 15W40 HYFILM LEO HD 15W40, API CK-4
Product Number P1515 0012-1540-14, 12/32 oz CASE
Manufacturer PUREGUARD HYDROTEX
Sub-total for Item 3: $240,656.00 N/A $579,508.62
4 TRANSMISSION FLUID
Genuine Universal Tractor Hydraulic Oil SB-00,
or Proven Equal
4a. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 2,000 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $8.29 N/A $2,081.00
Extended Price $16,580.00 $74,929.00
Product Name BEL RAY PREM TRACTOR HYTORQUE
Product Number 30222241-001 0004-1030-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
4b. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 75 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $8.63 N/A $231.12
Extended Price $647.25 $2,466.80
Product Name BEL RAY 30224-017 HYTORQUE
Product Number CALUMET 0004-1030-8
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Texas Enterprises Inc. dba Golden West
. ) ) Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd. Arnold Oil of San Antonio Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) Oil Co. Hampel Oil Distributor Inc.
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 2375 Walsh Rd 8423 Easton 6374 Rittiman Rd 3010 Aniol St. 1245 N West St.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Wichita,
6100013891 CD TX 78224 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78219 KS 67203
Automatic Transmission Fluid MOPAR ATF 4, or
Proven Equal
4c. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 4,000 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $24.33 $20.28 $9.91
Extended Price $97,320.00 $81,120.00 $39,640.00
Product Name ATF+4 ATF4 MOBIL ATF+4 PATRIOT TRANSHIELD SYN MV ATF
Product Number VV352 102877 112462
Manufacturer VALVOLINE MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
4d. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 400 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $5.29 NO BID NO BID
Extended Price $2,116.00
Product Name ATF+4 ATF4
Product Number 822348 75206
Manufacturer VALVOLINE NAPA
Automatic Transmission Fluid, (DAXRON VI), or
Proven Equal
de. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 220 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $17.24 $10.77 $9.91
Extended Price $3,792.80 $2,369.40 $2,180.20
Product Name MAX LIFE DEX 6/MER GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF PARTIOR TRANSHIELD SYN MV ATF
Product Number VV326 46077311700 112462
Manufacturer VALVOLINE WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
4f, 12/1-quart case, price per quart 200 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $4.95 $4.46 $3.93 NO BID
Extended Price $990.00 $4,892.00 $786.00
Product Name MAX LIFE DEX/6 MER DEXRON VI GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF
Product Number VV3246 75208 4077311717
Manufacturer VALVOLINE NAPA WARREN OIL
Automatic Transmission Fluid, MERCON V, or
Proven Equal
4q. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 250 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $17.24 $10.77 $15.53
Extended Price $4,310.00 $2,692.50 $3,882.36
Product Name MAX LIFE DEX/6MER GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF XTREME GLOBAL ATF
Product Number VV326 4071311700 999999
Manufacturer VALVOLINE WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
4h. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 400 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $4.95 $4.03 $3.93 NO BID
Extended Price $1,980.00 $1,612.00 $1,572.00
Product Name MAXLIFE DEX 6/MER MERCON V GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF
Product Number V3246 75207 46077311717
Manufacturer VALVOLINE NAPA WARREN OIL
Synthetic Transmission Fluid Allison Tes 295,
No Substitutes
4i. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 2,500 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $29.88 $28.80 $27.54
Extended Price $74,700.00 $72,000.00 $68,850.00
Product Name TRANS SYND 668 MOBIL DELVAC 1 ATF CITGO SYNDURANCE 668 ATF
Product Number 15e2DF 122059 115049
Manufacturer CASTROL HD MOBIL CITGO
VersaTrans LV ATF Automatic Transmission
Fluid, or Proven Equal
4j. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $17.24 $10.77 $9.91
Extended Price $8,620.00 $5,385.00 $4,955.00
Product Name MAX LIFE DEX 6/MER GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF PATRIOT TRANSHIELD SYN MV ATF
Product Number VV326 46077311700 112462
Manufacturer VALVOLINE WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
4k. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 3,500 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $4.95 $6.34 $3.93 NO BID
Extended Price $17,325.00 $22,190.00 $13,755.00
Product Name MAX LIFE DEX 6/MER MAXLIFE LV ATF GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF
Product Number VV3246 VV2346 46077311727
Manufacturer VALVOLINE VALVOLINE WARREN OIL
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Matori Industries, Inc.
) ) ) Hays City Corp dbaTex-Con Qil Co. HJDJ American Lube Supply Inc Gonzales Auto Parts 404 E Sonterra Blvd
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 4906 Burleson Rd 8165 Whisper Oak 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Ste 375
Austin, San Antonio, Lardeo, San Antonio,
6100013891 CD TX 78744 TX 78266 TX 78041 TX 78258
Automatic Transmission Fluid MOPAR ATF 4, or
Proven Equal
4c. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 4,000 gallons
Unit Price $33.99 NO BID N/A $1,722.03
Extended Price $135,960.00 $125,708.19
Product Name TRITON HD ATF 1/55 HYTORQUE HV-ATF
Product Number 401001 0404-X-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 HYDROTEX
4d. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 400 quarts
Unit Price NO BID NO BID $6.32 $208.75
Extended Price $2,528.00 $3,548.75
Product Name SYNTHETIC ATF+4 1QT HYTORQUE HV-ATF
Product Number 633179001182 0404-X-6, 6/1GALLON CASE
Manufacturer CITGO HYDROTEX
Automatic Transmission Fluid, (DAXRON VI), or
Proven Equal
4e. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 220 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $11.55 $1,722.03
Extended Price $2,541.00 $6,888.12
Product Name BEL RAY FS MV HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number TEXT 0405-X-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
4f. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 200 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $3.59 $5.81 $208.75
Extended Price $718.00 $1,162.00 $1,878.75
Product Name ATF BEL RAY SYNTHETIC DEXTRON VI 1 QT HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number 6331400182 0405-X-6, 6/1-GALLON CASE
Manufacturer CALUMET CITGO HYDROTEX
Automatic Transmission Fluid, MERCON V, or
Proven Equal
4q. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 250 gallons
Unit Price NO BID NO BID $1,722.02
Extended Price $8,610.15
Product Name HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number 0404-X-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer HYDROTEX
4h. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 400 quarts
Unit Price NO BID NO BID $6.32 $208.75
Extended Price $2,528.00 $3,548.75
Product Name TRANSGUARD MERCON V 1QT HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number 633122001181 0404-X-6, 6/1-GALLON CASE
Manufacturer CITGO HYDROTEX
Synthetic Transmission Fluid Allison Tes 295,
No Substitutes
4i. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 2,500 gallons
Unit Price $33.99 $30.63 N/A $2,450.00
Extended Price $84,975.00 $76,578.75 $122,500.00
Product Name SPIRAX S6 ATF A295 1/55 BP AUTRANS CITGO TRANSMISSION FLUID, LIQUID DRUM, 55 GALLON
Product Number 550032968 15B481 632493001
Manufacturer SHELL CASTROL CITGO
VersaTrans LV ATF Automatic Transmission
Fluid, or Proven Equal
4j. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $11.55 N/A $1,722.03
Extended Price $5,775.00 $30,996.54
Product Name BEL RAY FS MV ATF HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number 0405-X-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
4k. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 3,500 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $3.59 N/A $208.75
Extended Price $12,565.00 $30,477.50
Product Name BEL RAY HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number 0405-X-6, 6/1-GALLON CASE
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Texas Enterprises Inc. dba Golden West
. ) ) Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd. Arnold Oil of San Antonio Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) Qil Co. Hampel Qil Distributor Inc.
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 2375 Walsh Rd 8423 Easton 6374 Rittiman Rd 3010 Aniol St. 1245 N West St.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Wichita,
6100013891 CD TX 78224 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78219 KS 67203
MERCON LV, or Proven Equal
41. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,00 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $17.24 $10.77 $9.91
Extended Price $17,240.00 $10,770.00 $9,910.00
Product Name MAX LIFE DEX 6/MER GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF PATRIOT TRANSHIELD SYN MV ATF
Product Number VV326 4607731700 112462
Manufacturer VALVOLINE WARREN OIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
4m. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 3,500 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $6.19 $3.93 NO BID
Extended Price $21,665.00 $13,755.00
Product Name MERCON LV GOLDEN WEST TECH/SYN ATF
Product Number XTNQLVC 46077318707
Manufacturer MOROTCRAFT WARREN OIL
POWERTRAN TM Fluid, or Proven Equal
4n. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 6,000 gallons
Unit Price $8.84 $11.55 $7.43 $6.17
Extended Price $53,040.00 $75,300.00 $44,580.00 $37,020.00
Product Name POWERTRAN TORQFORCE50W MOBIL 424| PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TRACTOR HYD
Product Number T0450D 101139 105049
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
40. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price $10.34 $12.35 $10.55 $8.17
Extended Price $5,170.00 $6,175.00 $5,275.00 $4,085.00
Product Name POWERTRAN TORQFORCE 50W MOBIL 424| PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TRACTOR HYD
Product Number TO450P 100978 103330
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL MARTIN LUBRICANTS
POWERDRIVE Fluid, or Proven Equal
4p. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 5,500 gallons
Unit Price $10.80 $11.55 $10.91 $13.67
Extended Price $59,400.00 $63,525.00 $60,005.00 $75,174.00
Product Name POWERDRIVE 10 OR 30 TORQFORCE 50W MOBIL TRANS HD 30| CITGO TRANSGUARD HD TRANS FLD
Product Number T0450D 103892 105400
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL CITGO
4q. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price $12.30 $12.35 $15.68 $16.08
Extended Price $6,150.00 $6,175.00 $7,840.00 $8,040.25
Product Name POWERDRIVE 10 OR 30 TORQFORCE 50w MOBIL TRANS HD 30| CITGO TRANSGUARD HD TRANS FLD
Product Number TO450P 100551 103377
Manufacturer P66 CHEVRON MOBIL CITGO
Sub-total for Item 4. $337,556.15 $266,689.56
Business hours are from _ _am.to__ p.m.,
days per week 8:00; 6:00; 7 8:00; 5:00; 5 7:00; 7:00; 6 7:00; 5:00; 5
Prompt Payment Discount NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: 05/21/2021 Matori Industries, Inc.
) ) ] Hays City Corp dbaTex-Con Qil Co. HJDJ American Lube Supply Inc Gonzales Auto Parts 404 E Sonterra Blvd
For. Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids 4906 Burleson Rd 8165 Whisper Oak 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Ste 375
Austin, San Antonio, Lardeo, San Antonio,
6100013891 CD TX 78744 TX 78266 TX 78041 TX 78258
MERCON LV, or Proven Equal
4. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 1,00 gallons
Unit Price NO BID $11.55 N/A $1,722.03
Extended Price $11,550.00 $30,996.54
Product Name BEL RAY FS MV ATF HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number 0405-X-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
4m. 12/1-quart case, price per quart 3,500 quarts
Unit Price NO BID $3.59 N/A $208.75
Extended Price $12,565.00 $30,477.50
Product Name BEL RAY HYTORQUE LV-ATF
Product Number 0405-X-6, 6/1-GALLON CASE
Manufacturer CALUMET HYDROTEX
POWERTRAN TM Fluid, or Proven Equal
4n. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 6,000 gallons
Unit Price $7.99 $8.29 N/A $2,081.38
Extended Price $47,940.00 $49,740.00 $228,951.80
Product Name POWERTRAN FLUID 1/55 BEL RAY PREM TRACTOR HYTORQUE
Product Number 402111 0004-1030-2, 55-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
40. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price $8.99 $8.63 N/A $231.12
Extended Price $4,495.00 $4,315.00 $23,112.00
Product Name POWERTRAN FLUID 1/5 BEL RAY HYTORQUE
Product Number 402112 004-1030-8, 5-GALLON DRUM
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
POWERDRIVE Fluid, or Proven Equal
4p. 55-gallon drum, price per gallon 5,500 gallons
Unit Price $7.99 $10.69 N/A $1,357.00
Extended Price $43,945.00 $58,795.00 $135,700.00
Product Name POWERDRIVE SAE 10 1/55 BEL RAY HY TRAX, SAE30 55 GAL
Product Number 402081 0041-30-2
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CAMULET HYDROTEX
4q. 5-gallon pail, price per gallon 500 gallons
Unit Price $8.99 $11.10 N/A $136.00
Extended Price $4,495.00 $5,550.00 $13,600.00
Product Name POWERDRIVE SAE 10 1/55 BEL RAY TO4-30 HY TRAX, SAE 5 GAL
Product Number 402082 0041-30-08
Manufacturer PHILLIPS 66 CALUMET HYDROTEX
Sub-total for Item 4. $321,810.00 $6,218.00
Business hours are from _ am.to_ p.m.,
days per week 6:00; 6:00; 5 8:00; 5:00; 5 8:00; 7:00; 5 8:00; 5:00; 5
Prompt Payment Discount NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 2% 10 DAYS
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