CODE REVISER USE ONLY

RULE'MAK'NG ORDER OFFICE OF THE CODE REVISER
PERMANENT RULE ONLY STATEOF WASHINGTON
DATE: December 26, 2019
CR-103P (December 2017) TIME. 191 PM
Impl RCW 34.05.
(Implements RCW 34.05.360) WSR 20-02-072

Agency: State Building Code Council

Effective date of rule:
Permanent Rules
LI 31 days after filing.
Other (specify) July 1, 2020 (If less than 31 days after filing, a specific finding under RCW 34.05.380(3) is required and
should be stated below)

Any other findings required by other provisions of law as precondition to adoption or effectiveness of rule?
U Yes No If Yes, explain:

Purpose: The purpose of this permanent rulemaking is to amend the 2018 Uniform Plumbing Code, as directed by the state
building code council on November 8, 2019. The implementation date is July 1, 2020.

Citation of rules affected by this order:
New:
Repealed:
Amended: 9
Suspended:

Statutory authority for adoption: RCW 19.27.031

Other authority: RCW 19.27.074

PERMANENT RULE (Including Expedited Rule Making)
Adopted under notice filed as WSR 19-16-154 on August 7, 2019 (date).
Describe any changes other than editing from proposed to adopted version:

.Proposed changes to WAC 51-56-0400 — Water consumption table 407.2 was modified
Proposed changes to WAC 51-56-0800- 807.3 Was struck.

If a preliminary cost-benefit analysis was prepared under RCW 34.05.328, a final cost-benefit analysis is available by
contacting:

Name: Richard Brown

Address: 1500 Jefferson St SE
Phone: 360-407-9277

Fax:

TTY:

Email: Richard.Brown@des.wa.gov
Web site: www.sbcc.wa.gov

Other:

Page 1 of 2



Note: If any category is left blank, it will be calculated as zero.
No descriptive text.

Count by whole WAC sections only, from the WAC number through the history note.
A section may be counted in more than one category.

The number of sections adopted in order to comply with:

Federal statute: New Amended Repealed
Federal rules or standards: New Amended Repealed
Recently enacted state statutes: New Amended Repealed

The number of sections adopted at the request of a nongovernmental entity:

New Amended 9 Repealed

The number of sections adopted on the agency’s own initiative:

New Amended Repealed

The number of sections adopted in order to clarify, streamline, or reform agency procedures:

New Amended Repealed
The number of sections adopted using:
Negotiated rule making: New Amended Repealed
Pilot rule making: New Amended Repealed
Other alternative rule making: New Amended Repealed
Date Adopted: November 8, 2019 Signature:

)
Name: Doug Orth %_27%:

Title: Chair, State Building Code Council

Page 2 of 2




AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-02-044, filed 12/30/15, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-56-003 ©Uniform Plumbing Code. The ((2645)) 2018 edition
of the Uniform Plumbing Code, including Appendices A, B, and I, pub-
lished by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Of-
ficials, is hereby adopted by reference with the following additions,
deletions and exceptions: Provided that chapters 12 and 14 of this
code are not adopted. Provided further, that those requirements of the
Uniform Plumbing Code relating to venting and combustion air of fuel
fired appliances as found in chapter 5 and those portions of the code
addressing building sewers are not adopted.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-02-044, filed 12/30/15, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-56-008 Implementation. The Uniform Plumbing Code adopted
by chapter 51-56 WAC shall become effective in all counties and cities
of this state on July 1, ((2646)) 2020.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-02-044, filed 12/30/15, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-56-0200 Chapter 2—Definitions.

205.0 Certified Backflow Assembly Tester - A person certified by the
Washington state department of health under chapter 246-292 WAC to in-
spect (for correct installation and approval status) and test (for
proper operation), maintain and repair (in compliance with chapter
18.106 RCW) backflow prevention assemblies, devices and air gaps.

210.0 Hot Water - Water at a temperature exceeding or equal to 100°F.

211.0 Insanitary - A condition that is contrary to sanitary principles
or is injurious to health.
Conditions to which "insanitary" shall apply include the following:

(1) A trap that does not maintain a proper trap seal.

(2) An opening in a drainage system, except where lawful, that is
not provided with an approved liquid-sealed trap.

(3) A plumbing fixture or other waste discharging receptor or de-
vice that 1is not supplied with water sufficient to flush and maintain
the fixture or receptor in a clean condition, except as otherwise pro-
vided in this code.

(4) A defective fixture, trap, pipe, or fitting.

(5) A trap, except where in this code exempted, directly connec-
ted to a drainage system, the seal of which is not protected against
siphonage and backpressure by a vent pipe.

(6) A connection, cross-connection, construction, or condition,
temporary or permanent, that would permit or make possible by any
means whatsoever for an unapproved foreign matter to enter a water
distribution system used for domestic purposes.

[ 11 0TS-1578.2



(7) The foregoing enumeration of conditions to which the term
"insanitary" shall apply, shall not preclude the application of that
term to conditions that are, in fact, insanitary.

218.0 Plumbing System - Includes all potable water, building supply
and distribution pipes, all reclaimed or other alternate source water
systems, all rainwater systems, all plumbing fixtures and traps, all
drainage and vent pipe(s), and all building drains including their re-
spective joints and connection, devices, receptors, and appurtenances
within the property lines of the premises and shall include potable
water piping, potable water treating or using equipment, medical gas
and medical vacuum systems, and water heaters: Provided, That no cer-
tification shall be required for the installation of a plumbing system
within the property lines and outside a building.

221.0 Spray Sprinkler Body - The exterior case or shell of a sprinkler
incorporating a means of connection to the piping system designed to
convey water to a nozzle or orifice.

225.0 Water Heater (consumer electric storage) - A consumer product
that uses electricity as the energy source to heat domestic potable
water, has a nameplate input rating of twelve kilowatts or less, con-
tains nominally forty gallons but no more than one hundred twenty gal-
lons of rated hot water storage volume, and supplies a maximum hot wa-
ter delivery temperature less than one hundred eighty degrees Fahren-
heit.

Water Heater (mini-tank electric) - A small electric water heater
that has a measured storage volume of more than one gallon and a rated
storage volume of less than twenty gallons.

Water/Wastewater Utility - A public or private entity, including
a water purveyor as defined in chapter 246-290 WAC, which may treat,
deliver, or do both functions to reclaimed (recycled) water, potable
water, or both to wholesale or retail customers.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 17-10-074, filed 5/3/17, effective
6/3/17)

WAC 51-56-0400 Chapter 4—Plumbing fixtures and fixture fit-
tings.

402.5 Setting. Fixtures shall be set level and in proper alignment
with reference to adjacent walls. No water closet or bidet shall be
set closer than fifteen (15) inches (381 mm) from its center to any
side wall or obstruction nor closer than thirty (30) inches (762 mm)
center to center to any similar fixture. The clear space in front of
any water closet or bidet shall be not less than twenty-four (24) in-
ches (610 mm). No urinal shall be set closer than twelve (12) inches
(305 mm) from its center to any side wall or partition nor closer than
twenty-four (24) inches (610 mm) center to center.

EXCEPTIONS: 1. The clear space in front of a water closet, lavatory or bidet in dwelling units and sleeping units shall be not less than 21 inches (533
mm).
2. The installation of paper dispensers or accessibility grab bars shall not be considered obstructions.

405.4 Application. No individual, public or private corporation, firm,
political subdivision, government agency, or other legal entity, may,
for purposes of use in the state of Washington, distribute, sell, of-
fer for sale, import, install, or approve for installation any plumb-

[ 2 ] 0TS-1578.2



ing fixtures or fittings unless the fixtures or fittings meet the
standards as provided for in this chapter.

407.2 Water Consumption. The maximum water use allowed in gallons per
minute (gpm) or liters per minute (lpm) for any of the following fau-
cets and replacement aerators is the following:

Lavatory faucets ((&5) 22
gpm/9.5 Ipm
Kitchen faucets ((&5) 22
gpm/9.5 Ipm
Replacement aerators ((&5) 22
gpm/9.5 Ipm
Public lavatory faucets other than 0.5 gpm/1.9 lpm
metering

407 .4 Metering Valves. Lavatory faucets located in restrooms intended
for use by the general public shall be equipped with a metering wvalve
designed to close by spring or water pressure when left unattended
(self-closing) .

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Where designed and installed for use by persons with a disability.
2. Where installed in day care centers, for use primarily by children under 6 years of age.

408.2 Water Consumption. Showerheads shall have a maximum flow rate of
not more than 2.5 gpm at 80 psi (9.5 L/m at 552 kPa), 1in accordance
with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1.

EXCEPTION: Emergency use showers shall be exempt from the maximum water usage rates.

408.4 Waste Outlet. Showers shall have a waste outlet and fixture
tailpiece not less than two (2) inches (50 mm) in diameter. Fixture
tailpieces shall be constructed from the materials specified in Sec-
tion 701.1 for drainage piping. Strainers serving shower drains shall
have a waterway at least equivalent to the area of the tailpiece.

EXCEPTION: In a residential dwelling unit where a 2 inch waste is not readily available and approval of the AHJ has been granted, the waste outlet,
fixture tailpiece, trap and trap arm may be 1-1/2 inch when an existing tub is being replaced by a shower sized per Section 408.6(2).
This exception only applies where one shower head rated at 2.5 gpm is installed.

408.6 Shower Compartments. Shower compartments, regardless of shape,
shall have a minimum finished interior of nine hundred (900) square

inches (0.58 m?) and shall also be capable of encompassing a thirty
(30) inch (762 mm) circle. The minimum required area and dimensions
shall be measured at a height equal to the top of the threshold and at
a point tangent to its centerline. The area and dimensions shall be
maintained to a point of not less than seventy (70) inches (1,778 mm)
above the shower drain outlet with no protrusions other than the fix-
ture valve or valves, shower head, soap dishes, shelves, and safety
grab bars or rails. Fold-down seats in accessible shower stalls shall
be permitted to protrude into the thirty (30) inch (762 mm) circle.

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Showers that are designed to comply with ICC/ANSI A117.1.
2. The minimum required area and dimension shall not apply for a shower receptor having overall dimensions of not less than thirty
(30) inches (762 mm) in width and sixty (60) inches (1,524 mm) in length.

411.2 Water Consumption. Water closets shall have a maximum consump-
tion not to exceed 1.6 gallons (6.0 L) of water per flush in accord-
ance with ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1. No water closet that operates on a
continuous flow or continuous flush basis shall be permitted.

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Water closets located in day care centers, intended for use by young children may have a maximum water use of 3.5 gallons per flush
or 13.25 liters per flush.
2. Water closets with bed pan washers may have a maximum water use of 3.5 gallons per flush or 13.25 liters per flush.
3. Blow out bowls, as defined in ANSI/ASME A112.19.2M, Section 5.1.2.3 may have a maximum water use of 3.5 gallons per flush or
13.25 liters per flush.

412.1 Application. Urinals shall comply with ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1,
ASME A112.19.19, or CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124. Urinals shall have an aver-

[ 3 ] 0TS-1578.2



age water consumption not to exceed 1 gallon (3.8 L) of water per
flush. No wurinal that operates on a continuous flow or continuous
flush basis shall be permitted.

414.3 Drainage Connection. Domestic dishwashing machines shall dis-
charge indirectly through an air gap fitting in accordance with Sec-
tion ((8686+4)) 807.3 into a waste receptor, a wye branch fitting on
the tailpiece of a kitchen sink, or dishwasher connection of a food
waste disposer. Commercial dishwashing machines shall discharge indi-
rectly through an air gap.

415.2 Drinking Fountain Alternatives. This section is not adopted. See
Building Code chapter 29.

418.3 Location of Floor Drains. Floor drains shall be installed in the
following areas:

1. Toilet rooms containing two (2) or more water closets or a
combination of one (1) water closet and one (1) urinal, except in a
dwelling unit. The floor shall slope toward the floor drains.

2. Laundry rooms in commercial buildings and common laundry fa-
cilities in multifamily dwelling buildings.

420.0 Sinks

420.1 Application. Sinks shall comply with ASME Al112.19.1/CSA B45.2,
ASME Al112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME A112.19.3/CSA B45.4, or CSA B45.5/IAPMO
2124 . Moveable sink systems shall comply with ASME A112.19.12.

420.2 Water Consumption. Sink faucets shall have a maximum flow rate
of not more than 2.2 gpm at 60 psi (8.3 L/m at 414 kPa) in accordance
with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1.

EXCEPTION: Clinical sinks, laundry trays, service sinks.

422.0 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures. For minimum number of
plumbing fixtures required, see Building Code Chapter 29 and Table
2902.1.

Sections 422.1 through 422.5 and Table 422.1 are not adopted.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 17-10-074, filed 5/3/17, effective
6/3/17)

WAC 51-56-0500 Chapter 5—Water heaters.

501.1 Applicability. The regulations of this chapter shall govern the
construction, location, and installation of fuel Dburning and other
types of water heaters heating potable water. The minimum capacity for
water heaters shall be in accordance with the first hour rating listed
in Table 501.1(2). See the Mechanical Code for combustion air and in-
stallation of all vents and their connectors. No water heater shall be
hereinafter installed that does not comply with the manufacturer's in-
stallation instructions and the type and model of each size thereof
approved by the authority having jurisdiction. A list of accepted wa-
ter heater appliance standards is referenced in Table 501 (2). Listed
appliances shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's
installation instructions. Unlisted water heaters shall be permitted
in accordance with Section 504.3.2.

[ 4 1] 0TS-1578.2



TABLE 501.1(2)1/3

Number of 1to 1.5 2to2.5 3to3.5
Bathrooms

Number of 1 2 3 2 3 4 5 3 4 5 6
Bedrooms

First Hour Rating?, | ((42)) | ((34) | ((34) | (34) | (67) | ((67) | ((80)) | ((67) | ((89)) | ((80)) | ((30))
Gallons 38 49 49 49 62 62 74 62 74 74 74

Notes: IThe first hour rating is found on the "Energy Guide" label.
2Nonstorage and solar water heaters shall be sized to meet the appropriate first hour rating as shown in the table, and shall be capable of
delivering hot water at the maximum system demand flow, as calculated in Section 610.0 or Appendix A, as applicable.
3For replacement water heaters, see Section ((F0+4-+++)) 102.4.

504.1 Location. Water heater installation in bedrooms and bathrooms
shall comply with one of the following:

(1) Fuel-burning water heaters may be installed in a closet loca-
ted in the bedroom or bathroom provided the closet is equipped with a
listed, gasketed door assembly and a listed self-closing device. The
self-closing door assembly shall meet the requirements of Section
505.1.1. The door assembly shall be installed with a threshold and
bottom door seal and shall meet the requirements of Section 505.1.2.
All combustion air for such installations shall be obtained from the
outdoors in accordance with the International Mechanical Code. The
closet shall be for the exclusive use of the water heater.

(2) Water heater shall be of the direct vent type.

505.2 Safety Devices. All storage-type water heaters deriving heat
from fuels or types of energy other than gas, shall be provided with,
in addition to the primary temperature controls, an over-temperature
safety protection device constructed, listed, and installed in accord-
ance with nationally recognized applicable standards for such devices
and a combination temperature and pressure relief valve.

506.0 Combustion Air. For issues relating to combustion air, see the
Mechanical Code.

Sections 506.1 through 506.9 are not adopted.
Sections 507.6 through 507.9 are not adopted.

507.2 Seismic Provisions. Water heaters shall be anchored or strapped
to resist horizontal displacement due to earthquake motion. Strappings
shall be at points within the upper one-third and lower one-third of
its vertical dimensions. At the lower point, a distance of not less
than four (4) inches (102 mm) shall be maintained from the controls to
the strapping.

507.13 Installation in Garages. Appliances in garages and in adjacent
spaces that open to the garage and are not part of the living space of
a dwelling unit shall be installed so that burners, burner-ignition
devices and ignition sources are located not less than eighteen (18)
inches above the floor unless listed as flammable wvapor ignition re-
sistant.

507.16 Venting of Flue Gases - Delete entire section.

Sections 507.18 through 507.22 are not adopted.

509.0 Venting of Equipment. Delete entire section.

510.0 Sizing of Category I Venting Systems. Delete entire section.

[ 51 0TS-1578.2



511.0 Direct Vent Equipment. Delete entire section.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 17-10-074, filed 5/3/17, effective
6/3/17)

WAC 51-56-0600 Chapter 6—Water supply and distribution.

601.1 Applicability. This chapter shall govern the materials, design
and installation of water supply systems, including backflow preven-
tion devices, assemblies and methods used for backflow prevention.

603.1 General. Cross-connection control shall be provided in accord-
ance with the provisions of this chapter. Devices or assemblies for
protection of the public water system must be models approved by the
department of health under WAC 246-290-490. The authority having Jju-
risdiction shall coordinate with the local water purveyor where appli-
cable in all matters concerning cross-connection control within the
property lines of the premises.

No person shall install any water operated equipment or mecha-
nism, or use any water treating chemical or substance, if it is found
that such equipment, mechanism, chemical or substance may cause pollu-
tion or contamination of the domestic water supply. Such equipment or
mechanism may be permitted only when equipped with an approved back-
flow prevention device or assembly.

603.2 Approval of Devices or Assemblies. Before any device or assembly
is installed for the prevention of backflow, it shall have first been
approved by the authority having jurisdiction. Devices or assemblies
shall be tested for conformity with recognized standards or other
standards acceptable to the authority having Jjurisdiction. Backflow
prevention devices and assemblies shall comply with Table 603.2, ex-
cept for specific applications and provisions as stated in Section
603.5.1 through 603.5.21.

All devices or assemblies installed in a potable water supply
system for protection against backflow shall be maintained in good
working condition by the person or persons having control of such de-
vices or assemblies. Such devices or assemblies shall be tested in ac-
cordance with Section 603.4.2 and WAC 246-290-490. If found to be de-
fective or inoperative, the device or assembly shall be replaced or
repaired. No device or assembly shall be removed from use or relocated
or other device or assembly substituted, without the approval of the
authority having jurisdiction.

Testing shall be performed by a Washington state department of
health certified backflow assembly tester.

TABLE 603.2

Backflow Prevention Devices, Assemblies and Methods
The following line is deleted from the table:

[ 6 ] 0TS-1578.2



Pollution Contamination
(Low Hazard) (High Hazard)
Device, Assembly or Applicable Back Back Back Back
Method Standards Siphonage Pressure Siphonage Pressure Installation
Backflow preventer ASSE 1022 X Installation includes
for carbonated carbonated beverage
beverage dispensers machines or
(two independent dispensers. These
check valves with a devices operate under
vent to the intermittent or
atmosphere.) continuous pressure
conditions.

603.4.2 Testing. For devices and assemblies other than those regulated
by the Washington department of health in conjunction with the local
water purveyor for the protection of public water systems, the author-
ity having jurisdiction shall ensure that the premise owner or respon-
sible person shall have the backflow prevention assembly tested by a
Washington state department of health certified backflow assembly
tester:

(1) At the time of installation, repair or relocation; and

(2) At least on an annual schedule thereafter, unless more fre-
quent testing is required by the authority having jurisdiction.

603.4.9 Prohibited Location. Backflow prevention devices with atmos-
pheric wvents or ports shall not be installed in pits, underground or
in submerged locations. Backflow preventers shall not be located in
any area containing fumes or aerosols that are toxic, poisonous, in-
fectious, or corrosive.

603.5.6 Protection from Lawn Sprinklers and Irrigation Systems. Pota-
ble water supplies to systems having no pumps or connections for pump-
ing equipment, and no chemical injection or provisions for chemical
injection, shall be protected from backflow by one of the following:
(1) Atmospheric vacuum breaker (AVB).
(2) Pressure vacuum breaker backflow prevention assembly (PVB).
(3) Spill-resistant pressure vacuum breaker (SVB).
(4) Reduced pressure principle backflow prevention assembly (RP).
(5) A double check valve backflow prevention assembly (DC) may be
allowed when approved by the water purveyor and the authority having
jurisdiction.

603.5.10 Steam or Hot Water Boilers. Potable water connections to
steam or hot water boilers shall be protected by an air gap or a re-
duced pressure principle backflow preventer.

603.5.12 Beverage Dispensers. Potable water supply to carbonators
shall be protected by a listed reduced pressure principle backflow
preventer as approved by the authority having Jjurisdiction for the
specific use. The Dbackflow preventer ((shadldt—>b tocated—n—aeccord
aree)) shall comply with Section 603.4.3. The piping downstream of the
backflow preventer shall not be of copper, copper alloy, or other ma-
terial that is affected by carbon dioxide.

603.5.14 Protection from Fire Systems. Except as provided under Sec-
tions 603.5.14.1 and 603.5.14.2, potable water supplies to fire pro-
tection systems that are normally under pressure, including but not
limited to standpipes and automatic sprinkler systems, except in one
or two family or townhouse residential flow-through or combination
sprinkler systems piped in materials approved for potable water dis-

[ 71 0TS-1578.2



tribution systems, shall be protected from back-pressure and back-si-
phonage by one of the following testable assemblies:
1. Double check valve backflow prevention assembly (DC).
2. Double check detector fire protection backflow prevention as-
sembly.
3. Reduced pressure principle backflow prevention assembly (RP).
4. Reduced pressure detector fire protection backflow prevention
assembly.

Potable water supplies to fire protection systems that are not normal-
ly under pressure shall be protected from backflow and shall meet the
requirements of the appropriate standard(s) referenced 1in Table
1401.1.

604.14 Plastic Pipe Termination. Plastic water service piping may ter-
minate within a building, provided the connection to the potable water
distribution system shall be made as near as is practical to the point
of entry and shall be accessible. Barbed insert fittings with hose
clamps are prohibited as a transition fitting within the building.

606.5 Control Valve. A control wvalve shall be installed immediately
ahead of each water-supplied appliance and immediately ahead of each
slip joint or appliance supply.

Parallel water distribution systems shall provide a control valve
either immediately ahead of each fixture being supplied or installed
at the manifold, and shall be identified with the fixture being sup-
plied. Where parallel water distribution system manifolds are located
in attics, crawl spaces, or other locations not accessible, a separate
shutoff wvalve shall be required immediately ahead of each individual
fixture or appliance served.

608.3 Expansion Tanks, and Combination Temperature and Pressure-Relief
Valves. A water system provided with a check wvalve, backflow prevent-
er, or other normally closed device that prevents dissipation of
building pressure back into the water main, independent of the type of
water used, shall be provided with an approved, listed, and adequately
sized expansion tank or other approved device having a similar func-
tion to control thermal expansion. Such expansion tank or other ap-
proved device shall be installed on the building side of the check
valve, backflow preventer, or other device and shall be sized and in-
stalled in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instruc-
tions.

EXCEPTION: Instantaneous hot water systems installed in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions.

608.5 Discharge Piping. The discharge piping serving a temperature re-
lief valve, pressure relief valve or combination of both shall have no
valves, obstructions or means of isolation and be provided with the
following:

[ 8 ] 0TS-1578.2



(1) Equal to the size of the wvalve outlet and shall discharge
full size to the flood level of the area receiving the discharge and
pointing down.

(2) Materials shall be rated at not less than the operating tem-
perature of the system and approved for such use or shall comply with
ASME All2.4.1.

(3) Discharge pipe shall discharge independently by gravity
through an air gap into the drainage system or outside of the building
with the end of the pipe not exceeding 2 feet (610 mm) and not less
than 6 inches (152 mm) above the ground pointing downwards.

(4) Discharge in such a manner that does not cause personal in-
jury or structural damage.

(5) No part of such discharge pipe shall be trapped or subject to
freezing.

(6) The terminal end of the pipe shall not be threaded.

(7) Discharge from a relief valve into a water heater pan shall
be prohibited.

EXCEPTION: Where no drainage was provided, replacement water heating equipment shall only be required to provide a drain pointing downward
from the relief valve to extend between two (2) feet (610 mm) and six (6) inches (152 mm) from the floor. No additional floor drain
need be provided.

609.9 Disinfection of Potable Water System. New or repaired potable
water systems shall be disinfected prior to use where required by the
authority having jurisdiction. The method to be followed shall be that
prescribed by the health authority or, in case no method is prescribed
by it, the following:

(1) The pipe system shall be flushed with clean, potable water
until potable water appears at the points of outlet.

(2) The system or parts thereof shall be filled with a water-
chlorine solution containing not less than 50 parts per million of
chlorine, and the system or part thereof shall be valved-off and al-
lowed to stand for twenty-four hours; or, the system or part thereof
shall be filled with a water-chlorine solution containing not 1less
than 200 parts per million of chlorine and allowed to stand for three
hours.

(3) Following the allowed standing time, the system shall be
flushed with clean, potable water until the chlorine residual in the
water coming from the system does not exceed the chlorine residual in
the flushing water.

(4) The procedure shall be repeated when a standard bacteriologi-
cal test for drinking water, performed by a laboratory certified for
drinking water in Washington state, shows unsatisfactory results indi-
cating that contamination persists in the system.

609.11 Insulation of Potable Water Piping. Domestic water piping with-
in commercial buildings shall be insulated in accordance with Section
C403.2.8 and Table C403.2.8 or Section C404.6 of the Washington State
Energy Code, as applicable.

610.4 Sizing Water Supply and Distribution Systems. Systems within the
range of Table 610.4 may be sized from that table or by the method set
forth in Section 610.5.

Listed parallel water distribution systems shall be installed in
accordance with their listing.

611.1 Application. Drinking water treatment units shall comply with
NSF 42 or NSF 53. Water softeners shall comply with NSF 44. Ultravio-
let water treatment systems shall comply with NSF 55. Reverse osmosis

[ 9 ] 0TS-1578.2



drinking water treatment systems shall comply with NSF 58. Drinking
water distillation systems shall comply with NSF 62.

The owner of a building that serves potable water to twenty-five
or more people at least sixty or more days per year and that installs
drinking water treatment units including, but not limited to, the
treatment units in Section 611.1, may be regulated (as a Group A pub-
lic water system) by the Washington state department of health under
chapter 246-290 WAC. See Washington state department of health publi-
cation 331-488 for guidance.

612.1 General. Where residential fire sprinkler systems are installed,
they shall be installed in accordance with the International Building
Code or International Residential Code.

Sections 612.2 through 612.7.2 are not adopted.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-02-044, filed 12/30/15, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-56-0900 Chapter 9—Vents.

N o

oanraan Tz + PR B PN 2N | atrarn Ao 1 Ln N N 1407 Eseonmt ESNE EIESAE

A\ S N & i i § W I CTTT (_/Lt/t/_L_L\_/(_/LLJ_L\, o COTITOUOTTITTUNOS Q1T [ S @7 i N ) 1T U - == 1T \_/\_/t/k, [ S N LT OO

LI PR RPN, £t ] P PN s I NN I Sy ot et = o ~oaad Toitlnd o ot -
A= S B W i & i g_)_LJ.J.v_L J_(_A.ll.l_L_L_Y AVV _L_L_LJ.J.\j LA.J.J._LL_,L_), T T [ S Ny @7 R Sy ) A oL W I CTTTTT A\ A Aun ey ) -
P Niirm e ah 11 hoaxz — Mz 1 £1 arer~ A IR £ 28 ~ A =~ MAasza e
tJ_L TTUITNLS [ N I & Ry S 1TV (&8 TITTE LTTTCTTT T T TITIT g_)t/J_ & aw 5 0 A ~ I (=5 TITCTE TTTTTATIT
aml Adoxzal a4 3 £ CN harn +AaatAAd 2 S~~~ A 23+ ACTNM T Q4
[SFyysw ) \.A.\/V\/_Lut/\/u 10 g \J\J, WIT T C T o T T Q1T [ PP W B W N & i i S ) W I CTT I 1T 1T O T
A A TIT 722 ))

(@ Ryaw o1 T [~

908.2.4 Water Closet. This section is not adopted.

911.1 Circuit Vent Permitted. A maximum of eight fixtures connected to
a horizontal branch drain shall be permitted to be circuit vented.
Each fixture drain shall connect horizontally to the horizontal branch
being circuit vented. The horizontal branch drain shall be classified
as a vent from the most downstream fixture drain connection to the
most upstream fixture drain connection to the horizontal branch. Given
its grease-producing potential, restaurant kitchen equipment shall not
be connected to a circuit vented system.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-02-044, filed 12/30/15, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-56-1500 Chapter 15—Alternate water sources for nonpota-
ble applications.

[ 10 ] 0TS-1578.2



r

PR | tro
tJU T I

PN

.
=}

N

) ah o1 1] 12N BN
T

ER N
W T

I

[ S

W c T T

[E g I R S

T

=

o

[SF 3 1% 3= "= SRS WA SRy A S a1 3 = mp e o) WA w 8 cOoO—OT

7

+~

Stz
Iy

n

T

.
=}

13

+

n

2

r
A\ U i i o iy

r
T

o

£l +
T OO

o

13

n

ah 11

ey

T

A3

(=
hoaxz

S N i AW A A

A\

cCOTTTTTO

oo TTE cO

oT

TTIoT

[ ) & i mg uy

oo

o

o

o

a
o L

oo

o

+
oI C

I AN

7
W

A

nayrt sz
P OoOMPCTTCyY

LN

1

5 I W iy @ g

EY

At

4

cO

T T T oo

TIave

TTCTOo

T

wWITC T T

Ty

O

—

T LToCcCUtT.

[© ¥ & i mps S )

PR, R ap
\iu(_/LJ.J. L._Y

r

RN

oo

o

=

N

+
JoLr o UOrC T Ot

3~

A

T e S R

» 7

o

PPN

=

| s i o CTTICT A\ W Cc T T

LT IT

TV Ity

(S I 4w e mpy w4

1o

1133

o

13

r

RN

oAtz

.
cCLrCCTOoCTInttTITCc

£V

oL TIraro

A
ENEA I 2N

cOTT T TTOo

T T Oo1lrl

cO
= Al

\jJ_(_A_Y WO T T | NS AwAw §
PP, IR |
aTTr

[ S

T

o

A
Ay

A

1+

N

i E s i WP W S A W g

£

o

=

4

4

O T Ty

z

=N

ah 11

(ST ¥ AW I w A e COTT

A7

C

|\ Er s s i g

A

oo T

T

[ 3 ¥ & iy mpn

mmaas S+~ (7.

4

+ o
C—CTttr

o C T vac

a1l W PN

AL T

Ty «

\& o o
LN
W T

[©F 3§ & i nys S )

XTIy

CIT

Bhaita 1 A4 -~ ol
(AT =R = 5T

K
CIIc

4

PN TN I

r
T

\

A

aszoe ]
SR ASES

ol o

\

(1

T

[ i N & iy e

A

P TIY

AT

T

A&

A\ o my 1 §

17

15017

o A
[CEsaws

17

15017

ot 2~ o
o CtCTTOTS

T IOU L« LT L eZ e« Z

T IOU L« L L.eZ L

13

7z oMoy
Tav ity B

ISy

PN S NP R Sy
(_A.\.AL_LJ.UJ.J.L__Y

T af ot Ay 2N
ST TcrTroLrtatCtOrTy cO—CcItT

ool o o oot
T o T [ SIS I U N S S ) [ e =y

AVVASY r
wWIrc e

o ot
o C T T

moey

¥y  osxzod
T A

ERINE

otk ]
POoTao=T

Nt
TToOT

akh 11

o
=}

<za 1z

o Al
[CEsaws

R

T T CcCIIIgoy

£

TIhO «

WTT T

A\ S s W

v yw)

[ ¥ & iy mpn m 0

v L Vv

£V

TT

Dot
T o CTaooT

m

aszoat

QT

£V

TT

EVE AN
I cC

1+
[ =y

S~ <

O OpMMP Ty

£V

TT

b1

O

W CTCTT

[SA VA i mp w2 wr Oy o CCTTite

W T T

C

O

W T T

o

0TS-1578.2



1 K
| awy (S i s 1T

+

S ] v g
“FMEY

P |
(S5 i N & s S

n

oo +1h 2 o IS
O CTIT Lo o T T ITUIT

T Ntz oo
TTIIC ML UV TOoOITUITS

1
x*

P B R

o

raoamym g o

o

P

aorcocracrTtUoultty

Nt e~ o n
COoOIToTcrocCc TtIOoOIry

o

e n

oCcarLrracTOlly

crrCcoctcto

O L CCT

OTT

[y g e g mp T

[CTyaws

v a1 rnlea =

an A £
(ST saws

v Ay aa o
T TO0TL

ra

1 m

L N N TV

1

R B

[ 1 A W S W A Wy i e

OISOy

\W i By @ i g ¥ i S W W

S

CLrapr L e To

O rTIitartoy

oy

£ 00

1

1333

S Al
T

=3

TT

LN r o
Ao m

W C

oY vz

T TOolr

|\ 3 S s i i @ e

LA & 3 ) w TTTOoOotTT

TOoT LTIt

O

S TWTOg T

-4y

[Cnw

o

N

—
COTITTIoTo

o

ENEW B N

QAT I
oCoWagTTy

v

LR
W T T

oAtz

ot

S F

v A Ao

T T T CCT

oI oT

O

gAY

| i

[CTFaws oIt TCTT

’

oL C

of this

1510Nns

The prov

1501.1 Applicability.
chapter and the Washington state department of health shall apply to

the construction,

=) )

f alternate water source

1r O

and repa

alteration,

systems for nonpotable applications.

effective

filed 12/30/15,

(Amending WSR 16-02-044,

AMENDATORY SECTION

7/1/16)

Chapter 16— Nonpotable rainwater catchment sys-

WAC 51-56-1600

13 A
Cssaws

+
T

n aszat A LA . L. +
Sy o C \wum

S A

VAN

\w 8

TIT

PToT T

T

oo T I rIOoOTICTT

O papvny

==

1rmer  asza
Sy S

n

N

[ = S == 2 AT

m

+
T

m

ot £

n
T o ToTIIrctTtTttTtT™

n

-~
CTIT Lo

L

o

+ 1
(S

T OTIT

[ I & ym mpm my oT

T

IO T

T

SO

1oy

PN

m
J ey § g B L WA W

ot

I ey

1224
[ S N B W L/I.\A._I_J.J.g I

aszoat Aya 0o

Oy o C oIt

~ad

S o A

+ 1

CIT

 —

COo Ty

Il S

cO7

T IroT

EwawS

\w 8

oI rOrOTT

alh 11

o
=}

sz 1=z

Ty oA
(S uavs

+

Lo

Em Oy o C

o oo CTo T UL pPUTCTTOT WTrC

TITT

[ i ¥ & gm mpm

AL = v

TS S

+~

o

+~
T

o A
Sz uavs

n

4

1T aon ~ 1+ N
cUlTo T UUT U 1Oy L g J_(./L\._L\JLL,

Nnat a1~

o

n

Aarnat+r~T1 ] 4+ 4
T TTO \,(./L_L_L(./L\._L\Jll,

T

1

PO

T

T

=

o 3 g
s s s

n

o3
O L LT

+

A £
(ST navs

r Arad o
00 L

I maoar o

N SN 2N

1o

1133

7

\ 3 By & i s i W) - OO0

O~
LN
W T

CLrop L oincT o

O rTIrtatroy

o

S A

11
SO ot

mal

e T

r

COWTT

AL

ney
AE 2230

TSP

ey
-

-~

o=l

1l v

= Y

EIEAWA EEWE S
T o Tt To

a1 on
vuk.,_LUJ.J.,

T C oL

INE AR AT

n

3

+
cCTOTr

N ER

31337 o

hoaszirner

1+ <z

zod sy + 1 TR SWNE |
OOy (S S AT =y

NN

12N
o

alh 11

oV Ty JoL Tour

T

C

TP OV

[ I Y & ym mpm

OTCTIT

mr

4

O LCICILr

alh

AL T

Ty .

o ITT T T (& S . a T |\ e By @ gy o)

XTIy

T

nor o
=T

CRr=

na A
\C RN S A S I B A A )

Ex3

11

A~ n ok

o

oo

o e

Th

T I

(2

T

e

T

CCTTOIT orirar I orro'o

T OTTIT

CLUSOS

17

102

A
[SFTaAws

17

102

ot 2~ o
oCCTTOS

LT UU I« L 1%

T

LT UU I« L 1%

0TS-1578.2

12



£V

13

~ £+ r Fraont 7
[ 3 i o o Ty

£l alhad

=N
o

m akh 11

P,

r
T

LRI
W T

R
tJU T 1T

L

CwW

[ 3§ & e g uy

T

VT

T T OolITT

Oy o COoTIr

13

=

7z ooy

I

B R ¥

PPN
T [Eawl L_J.J.UJ.J.L__Y

PP S Y S S
u_)(_/Ll_,J_u_)J_(_/L\_/L,UJ__Y

r

=
[

il o
[ SIS ) U R S S )

v

Wh o

o ot

Tav ity B

cTC o T

|awy

246200
Z

ZT

LA 3 wra oy

O Cc T

The provisions

1601.1 Applicability.

of this chapter and the Washington state department of health shall
apply to the construction alteration and repair of nonpotable rainwa-

ter catch systems.

WAC<) )

\%J

A

alh ot A o
CTiaptTttT

1o
[ = e a

0TS-1578.2

13



	WSR 20-02-072.pdf
	OTS-1578.2

