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Accredited Short Courses 

Title Department 

or Unit  

Institution Short Course Description Application 

deadline 

Additional information 

Short courses on 
Monitoring & 

Evaluation 

Centre for 
Learning on 

Evaluation 
and Results 

University of the 
Witwatersrand 

CLEAR offers short courses on evaluation 
that address a range of topical issues 

and methodological developments in the 
practice. CLEAR currently partners with 
the Kenya School of Government (KSG), 
and Ghana Institute of Management and 
Public Administration (GIMPA). 

Varies based on 
the short 

course, contact 
directly 

http://www.clear-

aa.co.za/news/wsg-short-

courses/ 

 

Short courses on 
Monitoring & 

Evaluation in the 
Public Sector 

School of 
Public 

Leadership 

University of 
Stellenbosch  

The School of Public Leadership offers a 
range of M&E related courses from a 

management perspective. These include 
short courses on Monitoring and 
Evaluation in the Public Sector; Policy 
Writing, Implementation and Evaluation; 
and Advanced Indicator Development for 

Monitoring and Evaluation.  

Varies based on 
the short 

course, contact 
directly 

December 2015 

  

http://www.schoolofpubliclea

dership.co.za/pre-

registration/ 

 

Short Course on 
Principles in 
Monitoring and 
Evaluation - 

Performance 

M&E 

Department 
of Business 
Management 

 University of 
Pretoria 

This training course focuses on building 
the capacity of professionals by providing 
training in monitoring and evaluation 
tools and techniques.  

Varies based on 
the short 
course, contact 
directly 

http://www.ce.up.ac.za/Cour

se?tabid=58&Course=1a2e86

f3-b8f2-df11-9e88-

0050569b0004 
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Title Department 
or Unit  

Institution Short Course Description Application 
deadline 

Additional information 

Programme in 
the Monitoring 
and Evaluation of 
Health 
Programmes 

Human health University of 
Pretoria 

The main topics covered include the 
development of monitoring and 
evaluation programmes for population, 
health and nutrition interventions (e.g. 
HIV and AIDS, STDs, TB, maternal 
health, family planning, child health and 

reproductive health). 

 

Varies based on 
the short 
course, contact 
directly 

http://www.ce.up.ac.za/Course?t
abid=58&Course=f83593e7-
b8f2-df11-9e88-0050569b0004 

 

Short courses in 
the Programme 
for Monitoring  & 
Evaluation 

practitioners 

Management National School 
of Government 

The National School of Government 
(formerly PALAMA) offers a 7 course 
programme for Evaluation Practitioners 
and Managers to apply Monitoring and 

Evaluation principles in the Public Sector 
in assessing organisational and/or 
programme performance in a specific 
context. 
  

 

Varies based on 
the short 
course, contact 
directly 

http://www.thensg.gov.za 
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Postgraduate diplomas 

Title Department 
or Unit  

Institution Diploma Description Application 
deadline 

Links 

Public & 
Developmen
t Sector 
Monitoring & 
Evaluation 

Postgraduat

e Diploma 
(PDM-M&E) 

School of 
Public and 
Development 
Management 

University of the 
Witwatersrand 

The School of Public and Development 
Management offers a one year 
Postgraduate Diploma in Public and 
Development Management (PDM) in the 
field of public & development sector 

monitoring & evaluation.  

By the end of 
November 
annually 

http://www.wsg.wits.ac.za/de
gree-
programmes/monitoring-and-
evaluation/ 

 

Postgraduat
e Diploma in 
Monitoring & 
Evaluation 

Methods 

Centre for 
Research on 
Evaluation, 
Science and 

Technology 

University of 
Stellenbosch 

The Centre for Research on Evaluation, 
Science and Technology at Stellenbosch 
University offers one-year postgraduate 
diploma in Monitoring and Evaluation 

(distance learning options available). 

By the end of 
September 
(RSA citizens) 
and August 

annually (non-
RSA citizens) 

http://www0.sun.ac.za/cre

st/?page_id=3435 

 

 

Masters studies 

Title Department  
or Unit 

Institution Degree Description Application 
deadline 

Links 

Masters of 
Philosophy 
(MPhil) in 
Monitoring & 
Evaluation 

Centre for 
Research on 
Evaluation, 
Science and 
Technology 

University of 
Stellenbosch 

The Centre for Research on Evaluation, 
Science and Technology at Stellenbosch 
University offers a two-year MPhil in 
Monitoring and Evaluation (distance 
learning options available). 

By the end of 
September 
(RSA citizens) 
and August 
annually (non-
RSA citizens) 

www.sun.ac.za/crest    

http://www.wsg.wits.ac.za/degree-programmes/monitoring-and-evaluation/
http://www.wsg.wits.ac.za/degree-programmes/monitoring-and-evaluation/
http://www.wsg.wits.ac.za/degree-programmes/monitoring-and-evaluation/
http://www.wsg.wits.ac.za/degree-programmes/monitoring-and-evaluation/
http://www0.sun.ac.za/crest/?page_id=3435
http://www0.sun.ac.za/crest/?page_id=3435
http://www.sun.ac.za/crest


Title Department  
or Unit 

Institution Degree Description Application 
deadline 

Links 

Masters in 
Management 
of Public & 
Development  
Sector 
Monitoring & 

Evaluation 
(MM-M&E) 

School of 
Public and 
Development 
Management 

University of the 
Witwatersrand 

The School of Public and Development 
Management offers a Masters in 
Management that aims to strengthen 
capacity in management as well as 
monitoring and evaluation.  

By the end of 
November 
annually 

http://www.wsg.wits.ac.za/degre
e-programmes/monitoring-and-
evaluation/ 

 

Masters 
(MPhil) in 
Programme 
Evaluation 

Section of 
Organisational 
Psychology 

University of 
Cape Town 

The Section of Organisational Psychology 
offers a Masters in Programme 
Evaluation comprising structured 
coursework and a research dissertation 

over one year.  

Usually by mid-
November 
annually 

http://www.commerce.uct.ac.za/
Managementstudies/orgpsy/mast
ers-in-programme-evaluation/ 

 

Masters in 
Public Health 
(MPH)  

School of 
Health 
Systems and 
Public Health 

University of 
Pretoria 

The Master of Public Health (MPH) 
programme prepares professionals for 
leadership roles in the management, 
improvement, and evaluation of health, 

health interventions, and the health care 
system. It is a two-year, practice-
oriented degree that addresses 
evaluation through public health.   

Historically by 
June, contact 
directly 

http://www.up.ac.za/school-

of-health-systems-and-

public-health 
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PhD studies 

Title Department  Institution Diploma and Degree Description Application 
deadline 

Links 

PhD 
Evaluation 
Studies 

Centre for 
Research on 
Evaluation, 
Science and 
Technology 

University of 
Stellenbosch 

The Centre for Research on Evaluation, 
Science and Technology at Stellenbosch 
University offers a PhD in Evaluation 
Studies by coursework and dissertation. 

Rolling basis, on 
condition of 
pre-proposal 
acceptance 

http://www0.sun.ac.za/crest/

?page_id=3476 

 

PhD in 
Programme 
Evaluation 

Section of 
Organisational 
Psychology 

University of 
Cape Town 

The Section of Organisational Psychology 
offers a PhD in Programme Evaluation by 

dissertation only.  

Rolling basis http://www.commerce.uct.ac.za/
Managementstudies/orgpsy/doct
orate-in-programme-evaluation/ 
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