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PAINT AND SUPPLIES 

1. PPG Sun Proof Exterior Gloss - Oil House & Trim Paint or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4325 5 Gallon Pail NO BID NO BID 
 

4326 1 Gallon NO BID NO BID 
 

4327 Quarts NO BID NO BID 
 
                                   Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __________________________________________  Product #: ______________________ 

                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 
 

2. PPG Sun Proof Oil Type Exterior Primer or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4329 5 Gallon Pail NO BID $__100.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4330 1 Gallon $__18.50 $____Per Gallon 20.00
                                  

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __1-70
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __Y24W8020

  
__ 

3. PPG 6-7 Interior/Exterior Latex Block Filler or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4332 5 Gallon Pail $__38.50 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 45.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4333 1 Gallon $__8.50 NO BID __ Per Gallon 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __6-7
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B2SW25__ 



Tabulation for:  PAINT AND SUPPLIES 
  Spec# 6519       Kalyn Karczewski 

 2 

 
 

4. PPG Alkyd Floor & Deck Enamel or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4336 1 Gallon $__20.25 NO BID __ Per Gallon 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __1-282 Series
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 

__ 

 

5. PPG Exterior/Interior Eggshell Floor & Deck Latex Enamel or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4338 1 Gallon $__16.50 NO BID __ Per Gallon 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __3-510
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 

__ 

 

6. PPG Pitt - Flex Exterior Masonry Coating or approved equal 
GROUP I - PAINT 

(4-110 Pitt - Flex Exterior Masonry Coating, Acrylic - Elastomeric) 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4339 5 Gallon Pail $__75.00 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 80.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4340 1 Gallon NO BID NO BID 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __4-110
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __ASW151

 
__ 
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7. *Zinzer brand Alkyd Cover Stain   (116 Gal.)- No Substitutions 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3304 1 Gallon $__17.75 $____ Per Gallon 21.95
 

__Per Gallon 

3305 Quarts $__5.49 NO BID __ Per Quart 
 
 

8. *Zinzer brand B-I-N White Primer/Sealer-No Substitutions 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3306  1 Gallon $__21.95 $____ Per Gallon 20.85
 

__ Per Gallon 

3307 Quarts $__7.95 $____ Per Quart 6.70
 

__ Per Quart 

3308 13 oz. Aerosol Can $__3.99 $____ Per Can 3.90
 

__ Per Can 

 

9. *Zinzer brand 1-2-3 Latex Stain Killer-No Substitutions 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4341  5 Gallon Pail $__89.49 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 92.50
 

__Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4342  1 Gallon $__18.39 $____ Per Gallon 18.90
 

__ Per Gallon 

4343  Quarts $__6.19 $____ Per Quart 5.95
 

__ Per Quart 
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10. Interior, latex base, flat, white and tints as per specifications or approved equal-No Substitutions 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4346 5 Gallon Pail $__30.25 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 45.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4347 1 Gallon $__6.25 $____ Per Gallon 9.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __14-110
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B30W3050

 
__ 

11. Sherwin Williams Pro-Mar 200 Flat Latex or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4348 5 Gallon Pail $__46.25 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 46.75
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4349 1 Gallon $__9.25 $____ Per Gallon 9.40
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __6-70
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B30W251

 
__ 

12. PPG Speedhide General Purpose Aluminum paint or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4350 5 Gallon Pail $__139.95 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 92.50
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4351 1 Gallon $__28.00 $____ Per Gallon 18.50
 

__ Per Gallon 

4352 Quarts NO BID NO BID 
 

4353 Pints NO BID NO BID 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __6-230
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __BS9511__ 
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13. Sherwin Williams Industrial Maintenance Enamel or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4354 5 Gallon Pail $__101.25 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 94.75
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4355 1 Gallon $__20.25 $____ Per Gallon 18.95
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __7 Line Series
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __BS4W2400

 
__ 

 

14. Industrial Enamel Latex Paint, Duron DTM  Semi-gloss or Approved Equal; Mfd. Duron DTM, Product # 
GROUP I - PAINT 

DU0095xxx series 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

43545  5 Gallon Pail $__103.00 $____Per 5 Gallon Pail 97.50
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4356  1 Gallon Container $__20.75 $____Per Gallon Container 19.50
 

__ Per Gallon Container 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __90-474
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B66W211

 
__ 

15. PPG 1721 Exterior Latex House Primer or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4357 5 Gallon Pail $__79.25 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 96.75
 

__Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4358 1 Gallon $__15.85 $____ Per Gallon 19.35
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __17-921
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B42W41

 
__ 
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16. Interior, latex base paint, semi-gloss, white and tints as per attached specifications or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4361 5 Gallon Pail $__62.50 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 55.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4360 1 Gallon $__12.50 $____ Per Gallon 11.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __14-510
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B31W3050

 
__ 

17. Interior, latex satin finish and tints as per attached specifications or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4362  5 Gallon Pail $__55.25 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 56.25
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4363 1 Gallon $__11.05 $____ Per Gallon 11.25
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __14-310
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B20WB9051

 
__ 

18. Industrial enamel latex paint, Duron Satin DTM or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3309 5 Gallon Pail $__118.50 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 97.50
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

3310  1 Gallon $__23.70 $____ Per Gallon 19.50
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __7-374
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B66W211

 
__ 
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19. Sherwin Williams Harmony Interior Latex Semi-Gloss or approved equal (approximately 300 gallons per 
GROUP I - PAINT 

month used by Allegheny County Housing Authority) 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

25025 5 Gallon Pail $__66.75 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 65.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

25026  1 Gallon $__13.35 $____ Per Gallon 13.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __9-500
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B10W951

 
__ 

20. Traffic marking paint, white acrylic water-borne, as per attached specifications or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

 275 Gallon Returnable Tote    $__2,598.87 NO BID __ Per Returnable Tote 
 

  55 Gallon Drum $ __519.63 NO BID __ Per 55 Gallon Drum 
 

4375 5 Gallon Pail $__49.18 NO BID __ Per 5 Gallon Pail 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______INSL-X________  Product #: __TP2310
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 

__ 

 

21. Traffic marking paint, yellow acrylic water-borne, as per attached specifications or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

 275 Gallon Returnable Tote    $__2,691.83 NO BID __ Per Returnable Tote 
 

  55 Gallon Drum $ __538.50 NO BID __ Per 55 Gallon Drum 
 

4377 5 Gallon Pail $__51.50 NO BID __ Per 5 Gallon Pail 
Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______INSL-X________  Product #: __TP2380

                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 
__ 
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22. Traffic marking paint, black acrylic water-borne, as per attached specifications or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

25020  55 Gallon Drum $ __551.54 NO BID __ Per 55 Gallon Drum 
 

25027  5 Gallon Pail $__52.06 NO BID __ Per 5 Gallon Pail 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______INSL-X________  Product #: __TP2320
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 

__ 

 

23. 100% acrylic latex base primer, flat, white and tints as per attached specifications or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4383 5 Gallon Pail $__51.45 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 49.75
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4382 1 Gallon $__10.29 $____ Per Gallon 9.95
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __6-2
                    The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B28W600

 
__ 

24. PPG Speedhide Acrylic Latex House Paint or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Finish Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

Flat 5 Gallon Pail $__69.25 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 80.00
High Gloss 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 
5 Gallon Pail NO BID $__90.00

Semi-Gloss 
__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

5 Gallon Pail $__77.50 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 85.00
Flat 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 
1 Gallon $__13.85 $____ Per Gallon 16.00

High Gloss 
__ Per Gallon 

1 Gallon NO BID $__18.00
Semi-Gloss 

__ Per Gallon 
1 Gallon $__15.50 $____ Per Gallon 17.00

 
__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __6 Line Series
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __A6,A8,A82 Series

 
__ 
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25. PPG Gloss - Oil Interior/Exterior Enamels or approved equal 
GROUP I - PAINT 

Non-Safety 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4391 5 Gallon Pail $__101.25 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 94.75
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4392 1 Gallon $__20.25 $____Per Gallon 18.95
Safety (as indicated by asterisk in specifications)  (40 Pails) 

__ Per Gallon 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4393 5 Gallon Pail $__127.50 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 140.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4394 1 Gallon $__25.50 $____ Per Gallon 28.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __7 Line
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __BS4W2400 Series

 
__ 

26. PPG Quick Dry Acrylic Spray Products - aerosol can 55 line or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4395  12 oz. can $__449.00 $____ Each 3.50
 

__ Each 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __55 Line
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __Controls Rust

 
__ 
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27. PPG Rez Interior Stain Polyurethane Clear Varnish or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4396 5 Gallon Pail NO BID NO BID 
 

4397 1 Gallon NO BID NO BID 
 

3327 Pint NO BID NO BID 
 

4398 Water Based Interior Urethane Clear 
Stain Finish 

$__21.75 NO BID __ Per Gallon 

 
4399 Water Based Interior Urethane Clear 

Glo Finish 
$__21.75 NO BID __ Per Gallon 

 
3328 Water Based Interior Urethane Clear 

Glo Finish 
$__8.65 NO BID __ Per Quart 

 
3329 Danis Oil Wood Finish Antique Satin NO BID NO BID 

 
3330 Pre-Stain Wood Sealer and 

Conditioner NO BID NO BID 

 
Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG Olympic________  Product #: __42784/42786

                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 
__ 

 

28. PPG Rez Interior Semi-Transparent Medium BaseOil Stain or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3331  1 Gallon $__26.25 NO BID __ Per Gallon 
 

4400 Quarts $__9.75 NO BID __ Per Quart 
Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG Olympic________  Product #: __44500

                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 
__ 
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29. PPG Interior/Exterior Solid Color Acrylic Latex Stains or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4401 5 Gallon Pail $__114.90 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 94.75
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4402 1 Gallon $__22.98 $____ Per Gallon 18.95
 

__ Per Gallon 

3332 Pint NO BID NO BID 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __77-1110
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __A1SW51

 
__ 

30. PPG Interior/Exterior Solid Color Alkyd/Oil Stains or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3334 5 Gallon Pail NO BID NO BID 

 
3335 1 Gallon NO BID NO BID 

 
Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __________________________________________  Product #: ______________________ 

                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 
 

31. PPG Exterior Stain and Wood Preservative Semi-Transparent or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4324 5 Gallon Pail NO BID $__125.00
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

3338  1 Gallon NO BID $__25.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __________________________________________  Product #: ______________________ 
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __A15TS__ 
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32. PPG Silicone Alkyd Finish Coatings or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4404 Gallon $__79.95 $____ Per Gallon 44.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __95-5000
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B56W300

 
__ 

33. PPG Speedhide Interior Alkyd Lo-Sheen Enamel or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish/Color Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3340 White & pastel 6-90 $__20.25 $____ Per Gallon 26.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __7-824
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B33WB151

 
__ 

34. PPG Speedhide Interior Alkyd Lo-Sheen Enamel or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3342 Midtone 6-105 $__20.25 $____ Per Gallon 26.00
 

__ Per Gallon 

3343 Deeptone 6-106 $__20.25 NO BID __ Per Quart 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __7-825/826
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B33TB151

 
__ 
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35. PPG Speedhide Eggshell Latex Enamel or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish/Color Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4407  White & pastel 6-411 $__13.25 $____ Per Gallon 9.96
 

__ Per Gallon 

4409  Midtone 6-415 $__13.25 $____ Per Gallon 9.96
 

__ Per Gallon 

4411  Deeptone 6-416 $__13.25 $____ Per Gallon 9.96
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __6-411
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B20W3050

 
__ 

 

36. Varnish, Stain, Sealer 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

24893 Interior wood clear sanding sealer NO BID NO BID 
 

24894  Interior wood oil clear varnish gloss NO BID NO BID 
 

24895  Interior wood oil clear varnish satin NO BID NO BID 
 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __________________________________________  Product #: ______________________ 
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 
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37. PPG Interior/Exterior Water Base Gloss Enamel or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish/Color Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4412 White & pastel 53-610 $__103.75 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 94.75
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4413 White & pastel 53-610 $__20.75 $____ Per Gallon 18.95
 

__ Per Gallon 

4414 Midtone 53-615 5 NO BID NO BID 
 

4415 Midtone 53-615 $__20.75 $____ Per Gallon 18.95
 

__ Per Gallon 

4416 Deeptone 53-616 $__103.75 $____ Per 5 Gallon Pail 94.75
 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

4417 Deeptone 53-616 $__20.75 $____ Per Gallon 18.75
 

__ Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __90-374
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __B66W211

 
__ 

38. "Deft" Clear Wood Finish, dries in thirty minutes or approved equal 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3344 Gloss Finish NO BID NO BID 

 
3346 Semi-Gloss Finish NO BID NO BID 

 
Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __________________________________________  Product #: ______________________ 

                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: __________________________________________     Product #: ______________________ 
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39. Pool paint, etc.  (400 gal) 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish/Color Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4418 Ramuc Acrylic Water-Base Pool 
Paints Type DS 

$__174.75
INSL-X WR 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail $__194.00

 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail 

3348 Ramuc Epoxy Type EP HI Build Kit NO BID $__184.00
 

__ Per Kit 

3349 Ramuc Epoxy EP Kit $__99.00
INSL-X 

__ Per Kit $__82.00

 

__ Per Kit 

3350 Thinner used with Epoxy Paints $__11.95
INSL-X 1G 

__ Per Gallon $__11.00

 

__ Per Gallon 

40. Pool Paint Synthetic Chlorinated Rubber-based (Black, Red & White) (400 Gal.) 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

24383 5 Gallon Pail $__204.37
INSL-X RP 

__ Per 5 Gallon Pail NO BID 

 
24384 1 Gallon $__41.50

INSL-X RP 
__ Per Gallon NO BID 

 
24385 1 quart NO BID NO BID 

 

41. Urethane Alkyd Gloss Enamel Paint 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

25021 Urethane Alkyd Gloss Enamel Paint $__101.25
PPG 7-282 
__ Per 5 Gallon Pail $__120.00

 

__Per 5 Gallon Pail 

25022  Urethane Alkyd Gloss Enamel Paint $__20.25
PPG 7-282 

__ Per Gallon $__24.00

 

__ Per Gallon 

25023 Urethane Alkyd Gloss Enamel Paint NO BID NO BID 
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42. Water and Solvent-Based Spray Marking Paint 

GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Finish/Color Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

25024 17 ounce can $__5.75 $____Each 4.99
 

__Each 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __55 Line
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __142-0041

 
__ 

43. Kilz Brand Alkyd Stain Killer-No Substitutions 
GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

     1 gallon $__19.35
PPG 17-931 

__Each NO BID 

 

44. Kilz II Brand Water Base Stain Killer-No Substitutions 
GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

     1 gallon $__15.85
PPG 17-921 

__Each NO BID 

 

45. Kilz Brand Shellac Base Stain Blocker-No Substitutions 
GROUP I - PAINT 

Item # Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

     1 gallon $__23.43
PPG 

__Each NO BID 
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GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

All items in this category being bid as “equal” must first be approved by submitting samples to: 
 

County of Allegheny Courthouse 
436 Grant Street, Pittsburgh, PA  15219 

Attn:  Jim Blettner, Paint Shop 
46. Drop cloths 9-11 oz. premium canvas white drop cloth, remnant type unacceptable. 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3351 12 x 15 $__22.95 $____Each 31.00
 

__Each 

3352  4 x 15 $__8.50 $____Each 11.00
 

__Each 

GROUP II - SUNDRIES 
PAINT BRUSHES AND PAINT ROLLERS (15 each) 

47. Liebco Premium Paint Brushes or approved equal 

Item # Type Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4419 Penn pure China bristle angular sash 2" $__5.48 $____Each 5.75
4420 

__Each 
Penn pure China bristle angular sash 2.5” $__7.25 $____Each 6.65

4421 
__Each 

Penn pure China bristle angular sash 3" $__8.84 $____Each 9.40
4422 

__Each 
AS730 Orel-nylon polyester angular sash 2" $__6.57 $____Each 6.80

4423 
__Each 

AS730 Orel-nylon polyester angular sash 2.5” $__7.79 $____Each 8.50
4424 

__Each 
AS730 Orel-nylon polyester angular sash 3" $__9.70 $____Each 11.00

 
__Each 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______WOOSTER________  Product #: __8130/8192
                        The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __171 Series

 
__ 
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GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

48. Bestt-Leibco Brushes or approved equal Scott: Polyester/Nylon Filament for use in latex & oil base.  For precision trim & window sash painting. 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4425 1-1/2” – ½” thick, 2-3/8” long $__6.78 NO BID __Each 
 

4426 *2" - 9/16" thick, 2 5/8” long $__7.10 $____Each 6.50
 

__Each 

4427 *2-1/2” – 5/8" thick, 2-7/8" long $__9.28 $____Each 8.75
 

__Each 

4428 *3" angle Polyester 1" thick $__10.73 $____Each 10.60
 

__Each 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______WOOSTER________  Product #: __8170
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __171 Series

 
__ 

GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

49. 100% Pure China Bristle for use in Oil Base 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4429 *3"-1" thick, 3-3/4" long (angle) $__10.95 $____Each 10.70
 

__Each 

GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

50. Golden Nylon Filament for use in Latex --Chiseled construction and flagged tips 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3353 *3"-1" thick, 3-5/8" long $__12.95 $____Each 14.25
 

__Each 

GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

51. Bestt Leibco Paint Brushes (Penn) 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4430 *107602-2" angle brush $__5.48 NO BID __Each 
 

4431 *107625-22” angle brush $__7.25 NO BID __Each  WOOSTER 
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GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

52. Inexpensive Throw Away Brushes 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4432 1" wide $__0.29 $____Each 0.30
 

__Each 

4433 *2" wide $__0.39 $____Each 0.40
 

__Each 

4434 *3" wide $__0.49 $____Each 0.59
 

__Each 

4435 4" wide $__0.99 $____Each 1.40
 

__Each 

 
GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

53. Medium Quality Poly Nylon Brush (Wooster #P3979) 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4436 1" wide $__1.15 NO BID __Each 
 

4437 2" wide $__1.25 NO BID __Each 
 

4438 3" wide $__1.99 NO BID __Each 
 

4439 4" wide $__2.85 NO BID __Each 
 

4440 Caulking and patching materials, dap alex 10 oz. tube acrylic latex/silicone white or approved equal.100Z Tub $__1.50 $____Each 1.65
 

__Each 

4441 M & H ready patch or approved equal. $__13.95 $____Per Gallon 14.50
 

__Per Gallon 
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GROUP II - SUNDRIES 
54. Bestt/Liebco Roller Covers and Frames or approved equal 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4442 Bestt/Liebco - pro cover 9" x 3/8” 9V55 $__2.19
WOOSTER AR 6319 

__Each $__2.10
 

__Each 

4443 Bestt/Liebco - pro cover 9" x 2” $__2.35
WOOSTER AR 586 

__Each $__2.45
 

__Each 

4444 Bestt/Liebco - pro cover 9" x ¾” $__2.62 $____Each 3.15
 

__Each 

4445 Long John - paint roller covers ¼” $__1.75 $____Each 2.50
 

__Each 

4446 Bestt/Liebco 9" x 1" $__2.68 $____Each 3.65
 

__Each 

 Bestt/Liebco-pro cover 4” x 3/8” nap $__1.19
WOOSTER AR 631 

__Each $__1.85
 

__Each 

 Bestt/Liebco-pro cover 4” x ¾” nap $__1.59
WOOSTER AR 623 

__Each $__2.00

 

__Each 

GROUP II - SUNDRIES 
54. Bestt/Liebco Roller Covers and Frames or approved equal (CONT.) 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4447 Bestt/Liebco 9" x 1-1/4” $__2.95 $____Each 3.50
 

__Each 

4448 *Long John refills 9380 Liebco $__1.75 $____Each 2.60
 

__Each 

3355 *Bestt/Liebco 9" x 1/2” L9V97 $__2.39 $____Each 3.25
 

__Each 

3356 Water Based Interior Urethane Clear Stain 
Finish NO BID $__41.00

 

__Each 

4449 *Bestt/Liebco 9" x 1/4" Mohair covered 9V28 $__2.55 NO BID __Each 
 

4450 *1/4” nap foam disposable 9" roller covers $__0.50 NO BID __Each 
 

4451 *4" Heavy-duty roller frame CR-4 $__1.09 $____Each 1.25__Each 
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GROUP II - SUNDRIES 

54. Bestt/Liebco Roller Covers and Frames or approved equal (CONT.) 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3357 *7" Heavy-duty roller frame PCR-7 $__2.99 $____Each 3.50
 

__Each 

4452 *9" Heavy-duty roller frame PCR-9 $__2.99 $____Each 2.35
 

__Each 

4453 *Long John Rollers 9281 Liebco $__4.19 $____Each 5.50
 

__Each 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __Bestt/Liebco_______  Product #: ______________________ 
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: ______

 
__ 

55. Assorted Tools 
GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3358 Metal painter's pot 5 qt. $__2.84 $____Each 3.15
 

__Each 

3359 Heavy duty bucket grid - 5 gal. $__1.39 $____Each 1.30
 

__Each 

4454 Joint compound.  Gold Bond or 
approved equal $__15.95 $____Per 5 Gallon 17.00

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __________________________________________  Product #: ______________________ 

__Per 5 Gallon 

                                                The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: ______
 

__ 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES
55. Assorted Tools (CONT.) 

  

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4455 Joint tape 250 ft. roll $__1.99 $____Each 1.95
 

__Each 

4456 Masking tape 1" painter grade 
economy or all- purpose unacceptable 

$__1.29 $____Each 1.25

 

__Each 

3360 Masking tape 2" painter grade 
economy or all-purpose unacceptable $__2.59 $____Each 2.60__Each 
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56. Petroleum Spirits 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4457 55 Gallon Drum NO BID NO BID 
 

4458 5 Gallons $__38.95 $____Per 5 Gallon 36.00
 

__Per 5 Gallon 

4459 2-1/2 Gallons $__17.95 NO BID __Per 2-1/2 Gallon 
 

4460 1 Gallon $__8.99 $____Per Gallon 7.50
 

__Per Gallon 

  

57. Lacquer Thinner 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4461 5 Gallons $__39.95 $____Per 5 Gallon 45.00
 

__Per 5 Gallon 

4462 1 Gallon $__9.49 $____Per Gallon 9.50
 

__Per Gallon 
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58. Gum Spirits of Turpentine 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Quantity/Size/Type Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4463 5 Gallon Container NO BID NO BID 
 

4464 1 Gallon $__17.95 NO BID __Per Gallon 
 

4465 Pro-Line Colorant (Tint Colors) $__14.95 NO BID __Per 16 oz. 
 

4466 Polyester Polymer Anti Graffiti Coating NO BID NO BID 
 

4467 Acetone $__7.69 NO BID __Per 1 Quart 
 

3362 Urethane Graffiti Cleaner $__42.50
PPG Prep 400 

__Per Gallon NO BID 

 
3363 Penetrol Paint Additive $__18.95 $_____Per Gallon 20.00

 
__Per Gallon 

4468 *7" Heavy-duty roller frame PCR-7 NO BID NO BID 
 

4469 Moisture Cure Urethane Masonry Sealer NO BID $__65.00
 

__Per Gallon 

4470 5%-7% Silicone Masonry Sealer NO BID $__20.00
 

__Per Gallon 

3364 Sand Surface Preparation $__28.95 $____Per Gallon 10.00
 

__Per Gallon 

4471 Wire Brushes $__1.39 $____Each 3.00
 

__Each 

3365 Metal Brush/Roller Spinner $__16.69 $____Each 17.50
 

__Each 

4472 Caulking Gun for 10 oz. Tubes $__2.58 $____Each 3.00
 

__Each 

4473 Caulking Gun for 22 oz. Tubes $__5.99 $____Each 6.50
 

__Each 

4474 2" Easy Mask Painting Tape $__2.99 $____Each 5.00
 

__Each 
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58. Gum Spirits of Turpentine (CONT.) 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Type Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

3366 Tac Cloth - Foremost $__0.49 $____Each 0.50
 

__Each 

4475 5-1 Tool-Hyde 02970 $__4.18 $____Each 4.50
 

__Each 

3367 Pail Hooks - Hyde 45110 $__1.29 $____Each 1.70
 

__Each 

4476 Joint Knife 6" - Hyde 02850 $__5.75 $____Each 9.00
  

__Each 

 

59. Putty Knife 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4477 1-1/2" - Hyde 02100/Flex $__2.95 $____Each 3.00
 

__Each 

4478 2" - Hyde 02250/Flex $__3.19 $____Each 3.25
 

__Each 

4479 3" - Hyde 02350/Flex $__3.99 $____Each 3.85
 

__Each 

4480 1-1/2" - Hyde 02150/Stiff $__2.95 $____Each 3.00
 

__Each 

4481 2" - Hyde 02300/Stiff $__3.19 $____Each 3.25
 

__Each 

4482 3" - Hyde 02400/Stiff $__2.89 $____Each 3.85
 

__Each 
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60. Sand Paper 3M 
GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Type Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4483 60D $__0.45 NO BID __Each 
 

4484 80D $__0.35 $____Each 0.37
 

__Each 

4485 100C $__0.33 NO BID __Each 
 

4486 150C $__0.33 NO BID __Each 
 

61. Extension Poles (Must have metal ferrules) Adjustable to following lengths 
GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Size Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4487 5' $__13.99 NO BID __Each 
 

4488 6' $__13.99 $____Each 15.50
 

__Each 

4489 10' $__18.99 $____Each 21.00
 

__Each 

4490 Painting Trays (9" roller) Metal 
Economy Grade #400 Bestt $__1.99 $____Each 2.25

 

__Each 

62. Steel Wool (8 pads/pk) 
GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Type Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4491 #0/Fine $__1.06 NO BID __Each 
 

4492 #1/Medium $__1.06 NO BID __Each 
 

4493 #2/Medium $__1.06 NO BID __Each 
 

4494 #3/Medium $__1.06 NO BID __Each 
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63. Emery Cloth 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Item # Type Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

4495 Fine $__0.99 NO BID __Each 
 

4496 Medium $__0.99 NO BID __Each 
 

4497 Coarse $__0.99 NO BID __Each 
 

4498 Denatured Alcohol $__9.39 $____Per Gallon 9.85
 

__Per Gallon 

4499 Skid-Tex, paint additive for non-skid surfaces $__1.99 $____Per 8 Ounce Box 2.00
 

__Per 8 Ounce Box 

3368 Japan Drier, additive for making paints dry 
quickly NO BID NO BID 

 
3369 Clear High Gloss Nitro Cellulose Lacquer NO BID NO BID 

 
3370 Clear Satin Gloss Nitro Cellulose Lacquer NO BID NO BID 

 
64. Paint Pan Liner – 5 pack  Sherwin Williams  #163-6133  or approved equal 

 
Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: __________________________________________  Product #: ______________________ 

                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __
 

163-6133___ 

65. O.T.M Acrylic Safety Yellow Paint Sherwin Williams #B66Y37 or approved equal 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

5 Gallons $__198.50 $____Per 5 Gallon 200.00
1 Gallon 

__Per 5 Gallon 
$__39.70 $____Per Gallon 40.00

 
__Per Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __90-330
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __

 
B66Y37___ 
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66. Silver-Brite Industrial Aluminum Paint Sherwin Williams #BS9511 or approved equal 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

1 Gallon $__28.00 $____Per 1 Gallon 18.50
 

__Per 1 Gallon 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______PPG________  Product #: __6-230
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __

 
B59511___ 

67.  Lightweight Joint Compound.  Gold Bond or approved equal 

GROUP III - MISCELLANEOUS PAINTING SUPPLIES 

Quantity Westmoreland Supply 
Total 

The Sherwin Williams Company 
Total 

5 Gallon $__16.99 $____Per 5 Gallon Pail 17.00
 

__Per 5 Gallon Pail 

Westmoreland Supply---Manufacturer: _______USG________  Product #: __LT/WT
                  The Sherwin Williams Company---Manufacturer: _______

__ 
Sherwin-Williams________  Product #: __

 
154-0855___ 

PERIOD OF CONTRACT:   March 1, 2011 through February 28, 2013 
 

 
N O T E S 

 
Westmoreland Supply Inc. 

• The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this 
specification. (Please be advised as this is a co-operative Invitation for Bid, this optional contract availability is not applicable to the City of Pittsburgh as your act of submitting a bid 
enables both the County and City to utilize the resultant contract.) 

 
• The bidder agrees to make this contract available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices 

quoted under this specification. (Please be advised as this is a co-operative Invitation for Bid, this optional contract availability is not applicable to the City of Pittsburgh as your act of 
submitting a bid enables both the County and City to utilize the resultant contract.) 
 

• The bidder put N/A All American When Available under the Buy American Certificate. 
 

• The bidder’s firm is a “Small Business” as defined by the Small Business Administration (13 C.F.R. 121.201, in most cases, this means a business with 500 of fewer employees). 
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The Sherwin-Williams Company 

• The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this 
specification. (Please be advised as this is a co-operative Invitation for Bid, this optional contract availability is not applicable to the City of Pittsburgh as your act of submitting a bid 
enables both the County and City to utilize the resultant contract.) 

 
• The bidder agrees to make this contract available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices 

quoted under this specification. (Please be advised as this is a co-operative Invitation for Bid, this optional contract availability is not applicable to the City of Pittsburgh as your act of 
submitting a bid enables both the County and City to utilize the resultant contract.) 
 

 
Company Name Address Contact Telephone Fax 

Westmoreland Supply Inc. 

Email 
3131 Penn Avenue 

Pittsburgh, PA 15201 Dave Cohen 412-261-4455 412-261-4542 

 

David.ws19comcast.net 

REMIT TO ADDRESS 
P.O. Box 126 

Greensburg, PA 15601 
   

The Sherwin-Williams Company 

David.WSF@comcast.net 

101 Prospect Avenue 
Cleveland, OH 44115 

Susan Murgie 
Justin Bowers 

412-874-4703 
724-553-1049 

724-941-3483 
412-321-1473 

Swrep4854@sherwin.com 

 

Swrep5516@sherwin.com 
REMIT TO ADDRESS 
1100 Western Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15233 

Rick Metz 412-322-2923  

 

Sw4359@sherwin.com 

Approved By: 
 

_____________________________________________________ 
Kalyn Karczewki, Purchasing Agent 
 
 

The above tabulation was checked with the original Bid and verified: 
 

______________________________________________________ 
FOR CONTROLLER 

 

mailto:Swrep4854@sherwin.com�

	45. Kilz Brand Shellac Base Stain Blocker-No Substitutions
	GROUP II - SUNDRIES

